ORDINANCE NO. 798-21

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND the Code of the Town of Bel Air by deleting and repealing Chapter
145 thereof, Building Construction, and replacing it with a new Chapter 145 to be entitled Building
Construction which provides for the adoption of the Town building code which chapter provides for the
establishment of standards and safeguards for the proper design, acceptable installation and adequate
maintenance of Building Construction within the Town of Bel Air, including but not limited to granting
and revocation of permits and the fixing of penalties and fees for violation of the chapter.

BE IT ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Board of Town Commissioners as follows:
Section 1.

The Bel Air Town Code be amended by deleting and repealing Chapter 145, Building
Construction.

Section 2.

The Bel Air Town Code is hereby amended by adding thereto new Chapter 145, Building
Construction, to read as follows:

§145-1  Office of Building Official

§145-2  General duties of the Building Official.

§145-3  Right of Entry of Building Official.

§145-4  Review and proposed construction in flood-prone areas.
§145-5  Adoption of Building Code.

§145-6  Definitions.

§145-7  Changes and additions to the International Building Code.
§145-8  Changes and additions to the International Residential Code.
§145-9  Adoption of the International Mechanical Cody.

§145-10 Effect on existing building permits.

§ 145-1 Office of Building Official.

A. The office of Building Official is hereby created and the executive official in charge shall be known
as the “Building Official”.

B. The Building Official shall be appointed by the Bel Air Board of Town Commissioners.

C. During temporary absence or disability of the Building Official, the appointing authority shall
designate an Acting Building Official.

§ 145-2 General duties of the Building Official.

A. The Building Official shall receive applications required by the Building Code, issue permits and
furnish the prescribed certificates. The Building Official shall examine premises for which permits
have been issued and shall make necessary inspections to see that the provisions of law are complied
with and that construction is practiced safely. The Building Official shall enforce all provisions of
the Building Code. The Building Official shall, when requested by proper authority, or when the
public interest so requires, make investigations in connection with matters referred to in the Building



Code and render written reports on the same. To enforce compliance with law, to remove illegal or
unsafe conditions, to secure the necessary safeguards during construction or to require adequate exit
facilities in buildings and structures, the Building Official shall issue such notices or orders as may
be necessary.

B. Inspections required under the provisions of the Building Code shall be made by the Building
Official or his/her duly appointed assistant. The Building Official may accept reports of inspectors of
recognized inspection services after investigation of their qualifications and reliability. No certificate
called for by any provision in the Building Code shall be issued on such reports unless the same are
in writing and certified to by a responsible officer of such service.

C. The Building Official shall keep comprehensive records of applications, of permits issued, of
certificates issued, of inspections made, of reports rendered and of notices or orders issued. The
Building Official shall retain on file copies of required plans and all documents relating to building
work so long as any part of the building or structure to which they relate may be in existence.

D. All such records shall be open to public inspection for good and sufficient reasons at the stated office
hours but shall not be removed from the office of the Building Official without his written consent.

E. Written reports shall be made to the Building Official's immediate superior once each month, or
more often if requested, including statements of permits and certificates issued and orders
promulgated.

§ 145-3 Right of Entry of Building Official.

The Building Official, in the discharge of official duties, and upon proper identification, shall have
authority to enter any building, structure, or premises at any reasonable hours.

§ 145-4 Review and proposed construction in flood-prone areas.

The Director of Planning and Community Development of the Town of Bel Air or his/her designee shall
be the agent of the Town Building Official for the purpose of reviewing all subdivision proposals, new
development proposals and building permit applications for new construction or substantial
improvements to determine whether the proposed building site is subject to the Town's flood
management requirements as specified in Chapter 210 of the Town Code.

§ 145-5 Adoption of Building Code.

For the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the construction, alteration, removal,
demolition, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of buildings and structures within the Town of
Bel Air, including but not limited to the granting and revocation of permits and the fixing of penalties
and fees, the Town of Bel Air hereby adopts the 2018 International Building Code, the 2018
International Residential Code and the 2018 International Mechanical Code (hereinafter referred to as
the "Building Code" or "code") published by the International Code Council, Inc., and by reference
thereto such codes are made a part of this chapter with the same force and effect as though set out in full
herein, save and except as such changes, amendments, revisions, deletions, subsections and/or additions
are specified in this chapter. If conflicts with this Code or with changes, amendments, revisions,
deletions, subsections and/or additions to that code are found elsewhere in the code, the most restrictive
provisions shall govern.



§ 145-6 Definitions.

As used in this code, the following terms shall have the meanings indicated:

Building Official - The Director of the Department of Public Works or his/her designee.
Department of Building Safety - The Department of Public Works.

ICC/ANSI A117.1 - The Maryland Accessibility Code set forth in Code of Maryland Regulations, Title
5, Subtitle 05.02.02.

2020 National Electric Code - The electrical standards and regulations (Chapter 180 of the Bel Air Town
Code).

2018 International Plumbing Code and The International Fuel Gas Code- The plumbing standards and
regulations (Chapter 353 of the Bel Air Town Code).

145-7 Changes and additions to the International Building Code.

A.  The following subsections are changes or additions to certain sections of the 2018 International
Building Code:

1) SUBSECTION 101.1 IS HEREBY AMENDED BY SUBSTITUTING "TOWN OF BEL
AIR" FOR "NAME OF JURISDICTION" IN THE SECOND LINE.

2) SUBSECTION 101.2.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

""101.2.1 APPENDICES. PROVISIONS IN APPENDIX B, BOARD OF APPEALS,
GROUP U - AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS; APPENDIX F, RODENT
PROOFING; AND APPENDIX I, PATIO COVERS, ARE ADOPTED AS PART
OF THE TOWN OF BEL AIR BUILDING CODE."

3 SUBSECTION 101.4.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “REFERENCE CHAPTER 202
OF THE HARFORD COUNTY CODE.” AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION.

“4) SUBSECTION 101.4.3 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “REFERENCE CHAPTER 202
OF THE HARFORD COUNTY CODE.” AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION.

S) SUBSECTION 101.4.4 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSETERED IN
LIEU THEROF:

“101.4.4 SUBSECTION 104.4 IS AMENDED BY DELETING "THE
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE" STARTING IN THE
SECOND LINE. AND REPLCAING WITH TOWN OF BEL AIR CHAPTER 364
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE.

(6) SUBSECTION 101.4.7 IS AMENDED BY ADDING "OR THE MARYLAND
REHABILITATION CODE (MBRC) SET FORTH IN COMAR 09.12.58" BETWEEN
THE WORDS "CODE" AND "SHALL" IN THE SECOND AND BY ADDING "THE
PROVISIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE SHALL
BE APPLICABLE TO ALL STRUCTURES WHERE CONSTRUCTION
COMMENCED PRIOR TO MARCH 1, 1968 AND LEGALLY EXISTING
STRUCTURES PERMITTED ON OR AFTER MARCH 1, 1968" AT THE END OF
THIS SECTION.

@) SUBSECTION 103.1 IS DELETED.



8) SUBSECTION 103.3 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE LAST SENTENCE: "FOR
THE MAINTENANCE OF EXISTING PROPERTIES, SEE THE INTERNATIONAL
PROPERTY CODE." DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“103.3 DEPUTIES. IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PRESCRIBED
PROCEDURES OF THIS JURISDICTION AND WITH THE CONCURRENCE
OF THE APPOINTING AUTHORITY, THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
WORKS SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO EMPLOY THE RELATED
TECHNICAL OFFICERS, INSPECTORS, PLAN EXAMINERS AND OTHER
EMPLOYEES. SUCH EMPLOYEES SHALL HAVE POWERS AS DELEGATED
BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.”

(&) SUBSECTION 104.6 IS AMENDED BY ADDING A NEW SENTENCE AT THE END
OF THE SUBSECTION: "NOTHING IN THIS SECTION SHALL BE DEEMED TO
RESTRICT OR OTHERWISE LIMIT THE PROVISIONS OF ANY OTHER
SECTION OF THE TOWN OF BEL AIR CODE."

(10) SUBSECTION 105.1.1 IS DELETED.
(11) SUBSECTION 105.1.2 IS DELETED.

(12) SUBSECTION 105.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE SUBHEADINGS
"ELECTRICAL", “GAS”, “MECHANICAL” AND "PLUMBING" AND BY
AMENDING THE SUBHEADING "BUILDING" BY ADDING AND MODIFYING
THE FOLLOWING SUB-ITEMS:

1. THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE SHALL NOT APPLY TO RESIDENTIAL
ACCESSORY STRUCTURES NOT MORE THAN ONE STORY IN HEIGHT
AND THAT ARE 200 SQUARE FEET OR LESS IN AREA AND ARE NOT
CLASSIFIED AS USE GROUP H, HIGH HAZARD.

14. THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE SHALL NOT APPLY TO THE
CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION OR MODIFICATION OF AN
AGRICULTURAL BUILDING, AS DEFINED IN SECTION 202 AND AS
IDENTIFIED IN APPENDIX C, SUBSECTION C101.1. A LEGALLY
EXISTING AGRICULTURAL BUILDING SHALL NOT BE CONSIDERED AS
A ‘CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY’ THAT REQUIRES A BUILDING PERMIT IF
THE SUBORDINATE USE IS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LIMITATIONS
SET FORTH IN SECTIONS 302.2, 302.2.1 AND ANY CODE SECTIONS
REFERENCED THEREIN OF THE 2003 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE.

15. ONE-STORY DETACHED ACCESSORY STRUCTURES TO USE GROUP R-3,
PROVIDED THE FLOOR AREA DOES NOT EXCEED 200 SQUARE FEET.

16. CONSTRUCTION TRAILERS AS DEFINED IN CHAPTER 2 OF THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AS ADOPTED.

(13) SUSECTION 105.2.2 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“105.2.2 REPAIRS. APPLICATION OR NOTICE TO THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL IS NOT REQUIRED FOR ORDINARY REPAIRS TO STRUCTURES.
SUCH RREPAIRS SHAL NOT INCLUDE THE CUTTING AWAY OF ANY



(14)

(15)

(16)

17)

(18)

)
20)

WALL, PARTITION OR PORTION THEREOF, THE REMOVAL OR CUTTING
OF ANY STRUCTURAL BEAM OR LOAD-BEARING SUPPORT, OR THE
REMOVAL OR CHANGE OF ANY REQUIRED MEANS OF EGRESS, OR
REARRANGEMENT OF PARTS OF A STRUCTURE AFFECTING THE
EGRESS, OR REARRANGEMENT OF PARTS OF A STRUCTURE AFFECTING
THE EGRESS REQUIREMENTS, OR OTHER WORK AFFECTING PUBLIC
HEALTH OR GENERAL SAFETY.”

NEW SUBSECTION 105.2.3 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“105.2.3 PUBLIC SERVICE AGENCIES. A PERMIT SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE INSTALLATION, ALTERATION OR REPAIR OF
GENERATION, TRANSMISSION, DISTRIBUTION OR METERING OR
OTHER RELATED EQUIPMENT THAT IS UNDER THE OWNERSHIP AND
CONTROL OF PUBLIC SERVICE AGENCIES BY ESTABLISHED RIGHT.”

SUBSECTION 105.3 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “OR ELECTRONICALLY”
AFTER THE WORD “WRITING” IN THE SECOND LINE.

SUBSECTION 105.5 IS AMENDED BY DELETING "180 DAYS" IN THE THIRD
LINE AND INSERTING "12 MONTHS" IN LIEU THEREOF.

NEW SUBSECTION 105.6.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""105.6.1 WITHHOLDING PERMITS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY
WITHHOLD THE ISSUANCE OF ANY PERMIT AND/OR PLACE A HOLD ON
INSPECTIONS IF THE APPLICANT, THE OWNER OR ANY INDIVIDUAL
LISTED ON THE APPLICATION AS A RESPONSIBLE OFFICER (IF THE
APPLICANT IS A BUSINESS ENTITY) HAS FAILED TO REMEDY OR
CORRECT ANY EXISTING/ALLEGED VIOLATION OF THE TOWN CODE
ON ANY CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS IN BEL AIR, MARYLAND, FOR
WHICH THE APPLICANT HAS BEEN CITED BY ANY STATE, COUNTY OR
MUNICIPAL AGENCY."

NEW SUBSECTION 105.8 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""105.8 TRANSFER OF PERMITS. WHEN A CHANGE OF OWNERSHIP
OCCURS FOR A PROPERTY FOR WHICH A BUILDING PERMIT
APPLICATION HAS BEEN MADE OR A PERMIT HAS BEEN ISSUED, THE
APPLICATION OR PERMIT MAY BE TRANSFERRED TO THE NEW
PROPERTY OWNER AFTER SUBMISSION TO THE TOWN OF EVIDENCE
OF THE TRANSFER OF OWNERSHIP."

SUBSECTION 106 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SUBSECTION 106.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“106.1 LIVE LOADS POSTED. IN COMMERCIAL OR INDUSTRIAL
BUILDINGS, FOR EACH FLOOR OR PORTION THEREOF DESIGNED FOR
LIVE LOADS EXCEEDING 50 PSF (2.40KN/M2) THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
BILL NO. 19-032 BILL NO. 19-032 SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO
REQUIRE SUCH DESIGN LIVE LOADS TO BE CONSPICUOUSLY POSTED
BY THE OWNER OR THE OWNER’S AUTHORIZED AGENT IN THAT PART



1)

22)

23)

24

25)

(26)

27

OF EACH STORY IN WHICH THEY APPLY, USING DURABLE SIGNS. IT
SHALL BE UNLAWFUL TO REMOVE OR DEFACE SUCH NOTICES.”

SUBSECTION 107.3.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE PHRASE “WITHIN 180
DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS CODE AND HAS NOT BEEN
ABANDONED.” BEGINNING IN THE SIXTH LINE AND INSERTING THE
FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF: “AND THE PERMIT HAS NOT EXPIRED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 10s.5”

SUBSECTION 109.2 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

"109.2 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES. ON BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES,
MECHANICAL SYSTEMS OR ALTERATIONS REQUIRING A PERMIT, A
FEE FOR EACH PERMIT SHALL BE PAID AS REQUIRED, IN ACCORDANCE
WITH THE CURRENT TOWN OF BEL AIR FEE SCHEDULE."

SUBSECTION 109.3 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE LAST TWO SENTENCES:
“IF, IN THE OPINION OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, THE VALUATION IS
UNDERESTIMATED ON THE APPLICATION, THE PERMIT SHALL BE DENIED,
UNLESS THE APPLICANT CAN SHOW DETAILED ESTIMATES TO MEET THE
APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. FINAL BUILDING PERMIT
VALUATION SHALL BE SET BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.”

SUBSECTION 109.4 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“109.4 WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT ISSUANCE. ANY PERSON
WHO COMMENCES ANY WORK ON A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE
BEFORE OBTAINING THE NECESSARY PERMITS SHALL BE SUBJECT TO
A FEE ESTABLISHED BY THE TOWN OF BEL AIR FEE SCHEDULE THAT
SHALL BE IN ADDITION TO THE REQUIRED PERMIT FEES UNLESS
WAIVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL PURSUANT TO ESTABLISHED
POLICY.”

NEW SUBSECTION 110.1.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""110.1.1 PURPOSE OF INSPECTIONS. ALL INSPECTIONS CONDUCTED BY
THE TOWN ARE PERFORMED FOR THE PROTECTION AND PROMOTION
OF PUBLIC SAFETY, HEALTH AND WELFARE. THE INSPECTIONS ARE
MADE SOLELY FOR THE PUBLIC BENEFIT AND ARE NOT TO BE
CONSTRUED AS PROVIDING ANY WARRANTY OF CONSTRUCTION TO
INDIVIDUAL MEMBERS OF THE PUBLIC."

NEW SUBSECTION 110.3.12 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""110.3 12 HAZARDOUS MATERIAL INSPECTIONS. AS DEEMED
NECESSARY BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, APPROVAL FROM THE
HARFORD COUNTY HAZARDOUS MATERIALS TEAM MAY BE REQUIRED
PRIOR TO A CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY BEING ISSUED."

NEW SUBSECTION 110.7 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""110.7 STANDARDS. ALL BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES AND
APPURTENANCES THERETO SHALL BE CONSTRUCTED STRICTLY IN



28)

29)

(30)

@31

(32)

(33)

(349

COMPLIANCE WITH ACCEPTED ENGINEERING PRACTICE. ALL
MEMBERS AND COMPONENTS OF THE STRUCTURE SHALL BE
INSTALLED, FITTED OR FASTENED, MOVED OR STORED IN SUCH A
MANNER THAT THE FULL STRUCTURAL CAPABILITIES OF THE
MEMBERS ARE OBTAINED. IMPROPER ALIGNMENT (LEVEL AND
SQUARE), FITTING, FASTENING OR METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION
SHALL BE CONSIDERED A VIOLATION OF THIS CODE."

SUBSECTION 111.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE PHRASE “OR OTHER
LAWS THAT ARE ENFORCED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING
SAFETY” IN THE THIRD LINE AND INSERTING THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“AND IS SATISFIED THAT THE WORK CONFORMS TO THE
REQUIREMENTS OF ALL OTHER APPLICABLE LAWS,”.

SUBSECTION 111.3 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING AT THE END
OF THE SUBSECTION: "ANY PERSON, FIRM OR CORPORATION ENGAGED
IN THE PROCESS OF SELLING PROPERTY IN WHICH A TEMPORARY
CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY IS ISSUED SHALL AT THE TIME OF
SETTLEMENT PRESENT TO THE BUYER A COPY OF THE TEMPORARY
CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY WHICH MUST INCLUDE A LIST OF
DEFICIENCIES THAT REMAIN TO BE CORRECTED."

SUBSECTION 112.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE PHRASE “THIS CODE” IN
THE THIRD LINE AND INSERTING THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOQOF:

“THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS”.

SUBSECTION 112.3 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE PHRASE “THIS CODE”
IN THE FOURTH LINE AND INSERTING THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“THE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS?”.

SUBSECTION 113.2 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING BETWEEN
THE WORDS “APPLY” AND “OR” IN THE FIFTH LINE: " THE DEPARTMENT
OF PUBLIC WORKS HAS MADE AN INCORRECT DETERMINATION THAT A
STRUCTURE OR EQUIPMENT WITHIN A STRUCTURE IS UNSAFE IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 116 OF THIS CODE.”

SUBSECTION 114.4 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE PHRASE "SHALL BE
SUBJECT TO PENALTIES AS PRESCRIBED BY LAW" IN THE LAST LINE AND
INSERTING THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOQOF:

"SHALL BE GUILTY OF A MISDEMEANOR, PUNISHABLE AS PROVIDED IN
CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE II OF THE BEL AIR TOWN CODE. EACH DAY THAT
A VIOLATION CONTINUES SHALL BE DEEMED A SEPARATE OFFENSE."

SUBSECTION 116.3 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

'"116.3 NOTICE. IF AN UNSAFE CONDITION IS FOUND, THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL SERVE ON THE OWNER, AGENT OR PERSON IN
CONTROL OF THE STRUCTURE A WRITTEN NOTICE OF VIOLATION



(35)

(36)

37

(38)

THAT DESCRIBES THE CONDITION DEEMED UNSAFE AND SPECIFIES
THE REQUIRED REPAIRS OR IMPROVEMENTS TO BE MADE TO ABATE
THE UNSAFE CONDITION OR TO DEMOLISH THE UNSAFE STRUCTURE
WITHIN A (SPECIFIED PERIOD OF) STIPULATED TIME. UNLESS THE
PERSON SERVED WITH AN ORDER MAKES A TIMELY REQUEST FOR A
HEARING PURSUANT TO SUBSECTION 116.7, THE ORDER BECOMES A
FINAL ORDER ON THE 11TH DAY AFTER SERVICE. IF A PERSON WHO
HAS BEEN ISSUED AN ORDER UNDER THIS SECTION MAKES A TIMELY
REQUEST FOR A HEARING, LE., REQUESTS A HEARING WITHIN 10 DAYS
FROM SERVICE IN ACCORDANCE WITH SUBSECTION 116.7, THE ORDER
BECOMES A FINAL CORRECTIVE ORDER IF THE TOWN
ADMINISTRATOR AFFIRMS THE ORDER FOLLOWING THE HEARING."

SUBSECTION 116.4 IS AMENDED BY INSERTING THE PHRASE “FIRST CLASS
IN THE THIRD LINE AFTER THE WORD “CERTIFIED”.

SUBSECTION 116.5 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING BETWEEN
THE WORDS “OF” AND “THE” IN THE LAST LINE: “SECTION 105.2.2 AND”.

NEW SUBSECTION 116.6 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

"116.6 ABATEMENT. IF A PERSON WHO HAS BEEN ISSUED AN ORDER
UNDER THIS SECTION FAILS, WITH THE TIME LIMIT SPECIFIED IN A
NOTICE OF VIOLATION OR ORDER, TO ABATE THE UNSAFE CONDITION
AS DIRECTED, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY TAKE WHATEVER
ABATEMENT ACTION MAY BE NECESSARY BY USE OF TOWN
EMPLOYEES AND EQUIPMENT AND/OR BY CONTRACT WITH PRIVATE
CONTRACTORS. THE COST AND EXPENSE OF ABATING THE UNSAFE
CONDITION SHALL BE SUBMITTED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL TO THE
DIRECTOR OF FINANCE TOGETHER WITH THE NAME OF THE OWNER
OF THE PROPERTY ON WHICH THE VIOLATION OCCURRED AS
DETERMINED FROM THE PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS.
THESE CHARGES SHALL CONSTITUTE A LIEN UPON THE REAL
PROPERTY AND SHALL BE COLLECTABLE IN THE SAME MANNER AS
REAL PROPERTY TAXES WITH THE SAME PRIORITY, INTEREST AND
PENALTIES. INITIATION OF ABATEMENT ACTION SHALL NOT
PRECLUDE THE ISSUANCE OF ANY OTHER ACTION OR LEGAL
PROCEEDINGS AUTHORIZED OR PERMITTED UNDER THIS CODE, THE
LAWS OF THE STATE OF MARYLAND AND THE COMMON LAW."

NEW SUBSECTION 116.6.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""116.6.1 NOTICE OF ABATEMENT ACTION. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL,
BEFORE OR WITHIN 10 DAYS AFTER COMMENCEMENT OF ANY
ABATEMENT ACTION, SHALL ISSUE A NOTICE OF ABATEMENT ACTION
TO THE OWNER OF THE PROPERTY ON WHICH THE ABATEMENT
ACTION HAS BEEN OR WILL BE COMMENCED. THE NOTICE SHALL
DESCRIBE THE ABATEMENT ACTION TO BE UNDERTAKEN AND SHALL
SPECIFY THAT THE COSTS FOR THE ACTION SHALL CONSTITUTE A
LIEN ON THE REAL PROPERTY OF THE OWNER. THE NOTICE OF
ABATEMENT ACTION ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL BE
SERVED AS PROVIDED FOR BY SUBSECTION 116.4 OF THIS CODE."



(39)

(40)

41)

(42)

NEW SUBSECTION 116.7 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""116.7 HEARING. THE PROPERTY OWNER OR AGENT RECEIVING A
NOTICE OF VIOLATION ISSUED UNDER SUBSECTION 116.3, A NOTICE OF
ABATEMENT ISSUED UNDER SUBSECTION 116.6.1 OR A LIEN UPON THE
REAL PROPERTY MAY REQUEST A HEARING WITHIN 10 DAYS FROM
THE RECEIPT OR POSTING OF SUCH NOTICE OR LIEN ISSUED BY THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL. THE REQUEST MUST BE IN WRITING AND SERVED
PERSONALLY ON THE TOWN ADMINISTRATOR OR BY CERTIFIED MAIL,
RETURN RECEIPT REQUESTED, BEARING A POSTMARK FROM THE
UNITED STATES POSTAL SERVICE. THE TOWN ADMINISTRATOR MAY
SUBPOENA ANYONE HAVING ANY CONNECTION WITH A HEARING
UNDER THIS SECTION AS A WITNESS OR TO GIVE EVIDENCE RELATING
TO A NOTICE OF VIOLATION."

NEW SUBSECTION 116.8 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""116.8 FINALITY OF LIEN. UNLESS A PERSON SERVED WITH A NOTICE
OF ABATEMENT MAKES A TIMELY REQUEST FOR A HEARING
PURSUANT TO SUBSECTION 116.7, THE LIEN SHALL BECOME FINAL ON
THE PROPERTY UPON COMPLETION OF THE WORK. IF A PERSON
MAKES A TIMELY REQUEST FOR A HEARING, ANY LIEN ON THE
PROPERTY SHALL BECOME FINAL AFTER COMPLETION OF ALL THE
WORK THE TOWN ADMINISTRATOR DETERMINES WAS PROPERLY
CONDUCTED BY WAY OF ABATEMENT ACTION."

NEW SUBSECTION 116.9 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""116.9 UNAUTHORIZED TAMPERING. SIGNS, PLACARDS, NOTICES OR
OTHER POSTINGS AFFIXED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR HIS/HER
ASSIGNEE UNDER SECTION 116 SHALL NOT BE MUTILATED,
DESTROYED OR TAMPERED WITH, OR REMOVED WITHOUT
AUTHORIZATION FROM THE BUILDING OFFICAIL OR HIS/HER
ASSIGNEE.”

NEW SECTION 117 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
SECTION 117
EMERGENCY MEASURES

117.1 IMMINENT DANGER. WHEN, IN THE OPINION OF THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL, THERE IS IMMINENT DANGER OF FAILURE OR COLLAPSE OF A
BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR ANY PART THEREOF WHICH ENDANGERS
LIFE, OR WHEN ANY STRUCTURE OR PART OF A STRUCTURE HAS FALLEN
AND LIFE IS ENDANGERED BY THE OCCUPATION OF THE BUILDING OR
STRUCTURE, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED AND
EMPOWERED TO ORDER AND REQUIRE THE OCCUPANTS TO VACATE THE
SAME FORTHWITH. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL POST AT EACH
ENTRANCE OF SUCH STRUCTURE A NOTICE READING AS FOLLOWS: "THIS
STRUCTURE IS UNSAFE AND ITS OCCUPANCY HAS BEEN PROHIBITED BY
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. IT SHALL BE UNLAWFUL FOR ANY PERSON TO
ENTER SUCH STRUCTURE EXCEPT FOR THE PURPOSE OF MAKING THE
REQUIRED REPAIRS OR OF DEMOLISHING THE SAME."



(43)

117.2 TEMPORARY SAFEGUARDS. WHEN, IN THE OPINION OF THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL, THERE IS IMMINENT DANGER DUE TO AN UNSAFE
CONDITION, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL CAUSE THE NECESSARY
WORK TO BE DONE TO RENDER SUCH STRUCTURE TEMPORARILY SAFE,
WHETHER OR NOT THE LEGAL PROCEDURE HEREIN DESCRIBED HAS
BEEN INSTITUTED.

117.3 CLOSING STREETS. WHEN NECESSARY FOR PUBLIC SAFETY, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL TEMPORARILY CLOSE STRUCTURES AND
CLOSE, OR ORDER THE AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION TO CLOSE,
SIDEWALKS, STREETS, PUBLIC WAYS AND PLACES ADJACENT TO UNSAFE
STRUCTURES AND PROHIBIT THE SAME FROM BEING USED.

117.4 EMERGENCY REPAIRS. FOR THE PURPOSES OF THIS SECTION, THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL EMPLOY THE NECESSARY LABOR AND
MATERIALS TO PERFORM THE REQUIRED WORK AS EXPEDITIOUSLY AS
POSSIBLE.

117.5 COST OF EMERGENCY REPAIRS. COSTS INCURRED IN THE
PERFORMANCE OF EMERGENCY WORK SHALL BE PAID FROM THE
TREASURY OF THE JURISDICTION ON APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL. THE LEGAL COUNSEL OF THE JURISDICTION SHALL INSTITUTE
APPROPRIATE ACTION AGAINST THE OWNER OF THE PREMISES WHERE
THE UNSAFE STRUCTURE IS OR WAS LOCATED.

117.6 UNSAFE EQUIPMENT. EQUIPMENT DEEMED UNSAFE BY THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL NOT BE OPERATED AFTER THE DATE STATED
IN THE WRITTEN NOTICE UNLESS THE REQUIRED REPAIRS OR CHANGES
HAVE BEEN MADE AND THE EQUIPMENT HAS BEEN APPROVED OR UNLESS
AN EXTENSION OF TIME HAS BEEN SECURED FROM THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL IN WRITING.

117.6.1 AUTHORITY TO SEAL EQUIPMENT. IN THE CASE OF AN
EMERGENCY, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO
IMMEDIATELY SEAL OUT OF SERVICE ANY UNSAFE DEVICE OR
EQUIPMENT REGULATED BY THIS CODE.

117.6.2 UNLAWFUL TO REMOVE SEAL. ANY DEVICE OR EQUIPMENT
SEALED OUT OF SERVICE BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL BE PLAINLY
IDENTIFIED IN AN APPROVED MANNER. THE IDENTIFICATION SHALL NOT
BE TAMPERED WITH, DEFACED OR REMOVED EXCEPT BY THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL AND SHALL INDICATE THE REASON FOR SUCH SEALING.

SECTION 202 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITION
BETWEEN THE TERMS “CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS" AND
"CONSTRUCTION TYPES":

"CONSTRUCTION TRAILER. A SINGLE UNIT INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING
THAT MEETS ALL OF THE FOLLOWING CRITERIA:

1. HAS A BODY WIDTH OF NO MORE THAN 12 FEET AND HAS A BODY
LENGTH NOT TO EXCEED 60 FEET; AND



2. THE UNIT MUST BE PLACED ON AN ACTIVE CONSTRUCTION SITE
AND REMOVED WITHIN 30 DAYS OF COMPLETEION OF THE
CONSTRUCTION; AND

3. THE UNIT SHALL NOT BE OPEN TO THE PUBLIC AND SHALL BE FOR
THE EXCLUSIVE USE OF THE ON-SITE CONTRACTORS TO CONDUCT
NECESSARY BUSINESS OR TO STORE CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
RELATED TO THE CONSTRUCTION PROJECT; AND

4. ALL APPLICABLE ELECTRICAL AND PLUMBING INSTALLATIONS
HAVE APPROVED TEMPORAY PERMITS AND HAVE RECEIVED
APPROPRIATE INSPECTIONS AND OCCUPANCY APPROVALS."

(44) SECTION 202 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITION
BETWEEN THE TERMS "POWER-OPERATED DOOR'" AND "PREFABRICATED
WOOD I-JOIST":

"POWER SAFETY COVER. A POOL COVER THAT IS PLACED OVER THE
WATER AREA AND IS OPENED AND CLOSED WITH A MOTORIZED
MECHANISM ACTIVATED BY CONTROL SWITCH."

(45) SECTION 202 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITION
BETWEEN THE TERMS "PUBLIC ENTRANCE" AND "PUBLIC WAY"':

"PUBLIC SWIMMING POOL. A POOL OTHER THAN RESIDENTTIAL POOL
THAT IS INTENDED TO BE USED FOR SWIMMING OR BATHING AND IS
OPEPERATED BY AN OWER, LESSEE, OPERATOR, LICENSSE OR
CONCESSIONAIRE, REGARDLESS OF WHETHER A FEE IS CHARGED FOR
USE."

(46) SECTION 202 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITIONS
BETWEEN THE TERMS "RESIDENTIAL AIRCRAFT HANGER'" AND
"RESISITANCE FACTOR"':

"RESIDENTIAL. FOR THE PURPOSES OF THIS CODE, RESIDENTIAL
APPLIES TO DETACHED ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS AND
TOWNHOMES NOT MORE THAN 3 STORIES IN HEIGHT."

“RESIDENTIAL SWIMMING POOL. A POOL INTENDED FOR USE WHICH IS
ACCESSORY TO A RESIDENTIAL SETTING AND AVAILABLE ONLY TO
THE HOUSEHOLD AND ITS GUEST. ALL OTHER POOLS SHALL BE
CONSIDERED PUBLIC POOLS FOR THE PURPOSE OF THIS CODE."

(47) SECTION 202 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITION
BETWEEN THE TERMS "SOLID " AND "SPECIAL AMUSEMENT BUILDING":

"SPA. A PRODUCT INTENDED FOR THE IMMERSION OF PERSONS IN
TEMPERATURE-CONTROLLED WATER CIRCULATED IN A CLOSED
SYSTEM, AND NOT INTENDED TO BE DRAINED AND FILLED WITH EACH
USE. A SPA USUSALLY INCLUDES A FILTER, AN ELECTRIC, SOLAR OR
GAS HEATER, A PUMP OR PUMPS AND A CONTROL, AND CAN ALSO
INCLUDE OTHER EQUIPMENT SUCH AS LIGHTS, BLOWERS AND WATER-
SANITIZING EQUIPMENT."



(48)

(49)

(50)

(1)

(32)

(33)

(54)

(35)

(56)

CY)

SUBSECTION 502.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU
THEREOF:

“502.1 ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION. NEW AND EXISTING BUILDINGS
SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH APPROVED ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 115 OF THE TOWN OF BEL AIR CODE.”

SUBSECTION 903.2.1.2 IS AMENDED BY SUBSTITUTING “300” FOR “100” IN
NUMBER 2 BETWEEN THE WORDS “OF” AND “OR”.

SUBSECTION 1020.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING EXCEPTION:
"6. CORRIDORS CONTAINED WITHIN A SINGLE TENNANT SPACE."

SUBSECTION 1101.2 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

“1101.2 DESIGN. BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES SHALL BE DESIGNED AND
CONSTRUCTED TO BE ACCESSIBLE IN ACCORDANCE WITH COMAR
05.02.02.”

EXCEPTION: THE DESIGN OF COVERED MULTIFAMILY DWELLINGS AS
SET FORTH IN COMAR 05.02.02.05B(9) SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH
THIS CHAPTER AND ICC A117.1.

NEW SUBSECTION 1106.8 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“1106.8 IDENTIFICATION. EACH ACCESSIBLE PARKING SPACE
PROVIDED SHALL BE IDENTIFIED AS SET FORTH IN COMAR
05.02.02.07D.”

FIGURE 1608.2 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING NOTE:

“1. THE GROUND SNOW LOAD, PG, FOR TOWN OF BEL AIR, MARYLAND
SHALL BE 30 PSF.”

SUBSECTION 1612.3 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “INSERT NAME OF
JURISDICTION” IN THE SEVENTH LINE AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF

“TOWN OF BEL AIR” AND BY DELETING “INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE”
STARTING IN THE SEVENTH LINE AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF
“APRIL 19, 2016”.

SUBSECTION 1809.5 IS AMENDED BY DELETING METHOD 1 AND INSERTING
IN LIEU THEREOF

“1. EXTENDING BELOW THE FROST LINE ESTABLISHED AS 30” BELOW
FINAL GRADE.”

SUBSECTION 1809.5 IS AMENDED BY DELETING METHOD 1 AND INSERTING
IN LIEU THEREOF:

“1. EXTENDING BELOW THE FROST LINE ESTABLISHED AS 30 BELOW
FINISHED GRADE.”

NEW SUBSECTION 3001.1.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""3001.1.1 MARYLAND STATE ELEVATOR CODE. THE PROVISIONS OF
THIS CODE ARE IN ADDITION TO THE REQUIREMENTS IN THE
MARYLAND STATE ELEVATOR CODE. IF A CONFLICT BETWEEN THIS



CODE AND THE STATE CODE EXISTS, THE REQUIREMENTS IN THE
STATE CODE SHALL APPLY."

(58) SUBSECTION 3103.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING "WITHIN ANY 365
CONSECUTIVE-DAY PERIOD OR, WITH THE APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL, MULTIPLE PERIODS EQUALING FEWER THAN 180 DAYS WITHIN

ANY 365 CONSECUTIVE-DAY PERIOD" AFTER THE WORD "DAYS" IN THE
THIRD LINE.

(59) SUBSECTION 3103.1.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING "120 SQUARE FEET
(11.16 M?)" IN THE SECOND LINE AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF "400

SQUARE FEET (32.55 M?)" AND BY DELETING "10" IN THE FIFTH LINE AND
INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF "50."

(60) SUBSECTION 3109.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

“3109.1 GENERAL. ALL SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS SHALL
BE PROVIDED WITH BARRIER PROTECTION IN ACCORDANCE WITH
SECTION 305 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA
CODE. NO PROPERTY OWNER OR CONTRACTOR SHALL FILL A NEW
SWIMMING POOL OR SPA WITH WATER UNTIL A PERMANENT OR
TEMPORARY BARRIER HAS BEEN APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC WORKS. A TEMPORARY BARRIER MAY REMAIN IN PLACE FOR

NO MORE THAN 30 DAYS UNLESS APPROVED BY THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL.”

(61) NEW SUBSECTION 3109.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“3109.2 SUCTION ENTRAPMENT AVOIDANCE. ALL SWIMMING POOLS,
SPAS AND HOT TUBS SHALL BE PROVIDED IN ACCORDANCE WITH

SECTION 310 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA
CODE.”

(62) NEW SUBSECTION 3301.3 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""3301.3 HOUSEKEEPING. RUBBISH AND TRASH SHALL NOT BE
ALLOWED TO ACCUMULATE ON CONSTRUCTION SITES AND SHALL BE
REMOVED AS SOON AS CONDITIONS WARRANT. COMBUSTIBLE
RUBBISH SHALL BE REMOVED PROMPTLY AND SHALL NOT BE
DISPOSED OF BY BURNING ON THE PREMISES, AND THE AREA

ADJOINING AROUND THE OPERATION SHALL BE KEPT IN A SAFE AND
SANITARY CONDITION."

(63) NEW SUBSECTION 3301.4 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""3301.3 DRAINAGE NUISANCE. ANY SURFACE OR ROOF DRAINAGE
WHICH IS COLLECTED BY MAN-MADE MEANS ON A PROPERTY SHALL
NOT BE CHANNELED ONTO THE PROPERTY OF ANOTHER. ANY
CHANNELING OR COLLECTION OF WATER MUST BE DISSIPATED AND
DISPERSED ON THE COLLECTING PROPERTY TO NOT CAUSE DAMAGE
TO THE PROPERTY OF ANOTHER. SUMP PUMPS AND DRAINSPOUTS
SHALL NOT BE DISCHARGED CLOSER THAN 10 FEET TO THE PROPERTY



LINE. DISCHARGE SHALL NOT BE INTO THE TOWN SANITARY SEWER
SYSTEM."

(64) CHAPTER 35 REFERENCED STANDARDS UNDER THE NFPA 70-17 IS HEREBY
DELETED AND 70-20 IS INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF.

§ 145-8 Changes and additions to the 2018 International Residential Code.

A. The following sections are changes or additions to certain sections of the 2018 International
Residential Code:

1) SUBSECTION R101.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING "[NAME OF
JURISDICTION]" AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF "TOWN OF BEL AIR."

2) NEW SUBSECTION R101.4 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“R101.4 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION. THE PROVISIONS OF
CHAPTER 33 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE AS ADOPTED
IN THIS CHAPTER SHALL BE APPLICABLE TO ALL CONSTRUCTION SITES
POSSESSING A VALID BUILDING PERMIT.”

&) SUBSECTION R102.5 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

"R102.5 APPENDICES. PROVISIONS IN APPENDIX A, SIZING AND
CAPACITIES OF GAS PIPING; APPENDIX B, SIZING OF VENTING SYSTEMS
SERVING APPLIANCES EQUIPPED WITH DRAFT HOODS, CATEGORY I
APPLIANCES, AND APPLIANCES LISTED FOR USE AND TYPE B VENTS;
APPENDIX C, EXIT TERMINALS OF MECHANICAL DRAFT AND DIRECT-
VENT VENTING SYSTEMS; APPENDIX D, RECOMMENDED PROCEDURES
FOR SAFETY INSPECTION OF AN EXISTING APPLIANCE INSTALLATION;
APPENDIX E, MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS; APPENDIX
G, SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS; APPENDIX H, PATIO COVERS;
APPENDIX J, EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; AND APPENDIX K,
SOUND TRANSMISSION, SHALL BE DEEMED AS PART OF THIS CODE."

“) SECTIONS R103 THROUGH R114 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE ARE DELETED AND SECTIONS 102 THROUGH 117 OF
THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, AS AMENDED, SHALL BE
APPLICABLE.

S) SECTION R202 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE DEFINITION OF "FIRE
SEPERATION DISTANCE" AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF:

"FIRE SEPERATION DISTANCE. THE DISTANCE MEASURED FROM THE
BUILDING FACE TO ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

1. TO THE CLOSEST INTERIOR LOT LINE.

2. TO THE CENTERLINE OF A STREET, AN ALLEY OR PUBLIC WAY.
3. TO AN IMAGINARY LINE BETWEEN 2 BUILDINGS ON THE LOT.
4. TO AN EXCLUSIVE USE EASEMENT LINE.

THE DISTANCE SHALL BE MEASURED AT A RIGHT ANGLE FROM THE FACE
OF THE WALL.



(6)

(7

@®)

SECTION R202 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE DEFINITION OF
"MANUFACTURED HOME" AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF:

MANUFACTURED HOME: MANUFACTURED HOME MEANS A
STRUCTURE, TRANSPORTABLE IN ONE OR MORE SECTIONS, WHICH IN
THE TRAVELING MODE IS 8§ BODY FEET OR MORE IN WIDTH OR 40
BODY FEET OR MORE IN LENGTH OR, WHEN ERECTED ON SITE, IS 320
OR MORE SQUARE FEET AND WHICH IS BUILT ON A PERMANENT
CHASSIS AND DESIGNED TO BE USED AS A DWELLING WITH OR
WITHOUT A PERMANENT FOUNDATION WHEN CONNECTED TO THE
REQUIRED UTILITIES, AND INCLUDES THE PLUMBING, HEATING, AIR-
CONDITIONING AND ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS CONTAINED THEREIN.
CALCULATIONS USED TO DETERMINE THE NUMBER OF SQUARE FEET
IN A STRUCTURE WILL BE BASED ON THE STRUCTURE'S EXTERIOR
DIMENSIONS MEASURED AT THE LARGEST HORIZONTAL PROJECTIONS
WHEN ERECTED ON SITE. THESE DIMENSIONS WILL INCLUDE ALL
EXPANDABLE ROOM, CABINETS AND OTHER PROJECTIONS
CONTAINING INTERIOR SPACES BUT DO NOT INCLUDE BAY WINDOWS.

THIS TERM INCLUDES ALL STRUCTURES WHICH MEET THE ABOVE
REQUIREMENTS EXCEPT THE SIZE REQUIREMENTS AND WITH
RESPECT TO WHICH THE MANUFACTURER VOLUNTARILY FILES A
CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO SUBSECTION 3282.13 AND COMPLIES

WITH THE STANDARDS SET FORTH IN PART 3280.

NOTE: FOR MOBILE HOMES BUILT PRIOR TO JUNE 15, 1976, A LABEL
CERTIFYING COMPLIANCE WITH THE STANDARD FOR MOBILE HOMES,
NFPA 501, ANSI 119.1, IN EFFECT AT THE TIME OF MANUFACTURE IS
REQUIRED. FOR THE PURPOSE OF THESE PROVISIONS, A MOBILE

HOME SHALL BE CONSIDERED A MANUFACTURED HOME.

TABLE R301.2(1) IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING DESIGN
VALUES: “GROUND SNOW LOAD - 30 PSF; WIND - 90 MPH; TOPOGRAPHIC
EFFECTS — NO; SPECIAL WIND REGION - NO; WIND-BORN DEBRIS ZONE -
NO; SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY - B; WEATHERING - SEVERE; FROST LINE
DEPTH - 30 INCHES (762 MM); TERMITE - MODERATE TO HEAVY; WINTER
DESIGN TEMP -13° F.; ICE BARRIER UNDERLAYMENT REQUIRED - NO;
FLOOD HAZARDS - JULY 16, 1981 AND JANUARY 7, 2000; AIR FREEZING
INDEX - 554; MEAN ANNUAL TEMP - 31°F; LATITUDE - NEW SUBSECTION

R302.1.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE R302.1(1) IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING LINE AT THE

BOTTOM OF THE TABLE:

ALL PORTIONS OF
ATTACHED DECKS AND OPEN
ROOF COVERED DECKS.
OPEN ROOF COVERED
DECKS MAY HAVE A
MAXIMUM OPAQUE WALL
SURFACE AREA OF 50%

NOT ALLOWED

N/A

<2 FEET




9 TABLE R302.1(2) IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING LINE AT THE
BOTTOM OF THE TABLE:

ALL PORTIONS OF NOT ALLOWED N/A <2 FEET
ATTACHED DECKS AND OPEN
ROOF COVERED DECKS.
OPEN ROOF COVERED
DECKS MAY HAVE A
MAXIMUM OPAQUE WALL
SURFACE AREA OF 50%

(10) NEW SUBSECTION R312.1.5 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

"R312.1.1 AREAWAY GUARDS. A GUARDRAIL OR OTHER APPROVED
BARRIER SHALL BE INSTALLED ON AREAWAY WALLS WITH A GRADE
LEVEL ELEVATION DIFFERENCE OF GREATER THAN 48 INCHES (1219.2
MM). GUARDS SHALL BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH
SUBSECTION R312."

(11) SUBSECTION R313.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE EXCEPTIONS AND
ADDING THE FOLLOWING:

(12) 1. AN AUTOMATIC RESIDENTIAL FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR ADDITIONS OR ALTERATIONS TO EXISTING BUILDINGS
THAT ARE NOT ALREADY PROVIDED WITH AN AUTOMATIC RESIDENTIAL
SPRINKLER SYSTEM.

2. AN AUTOMATIC RESIDENTIAL FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM SHALL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR A NEW ONE-OR TWO-FAMILY DWELLING CONSTRUCTED
ON A LOT SERVED BY AN EXISTING SERVICE LINE FROM A WATER MAIN
TO THE PROPERTY LINE THAT IS LESS THAN A NOMINAL 1 INCH SIZE OR A
LOT SUBJECT TO A VALID, UNEXPIRED PUBLIC WORKS AGREEMENT THAT
WAS EXECUTED PRIOR TO MARCH 1, 2011. FOR A PROPERTY TO QUALIFY
FOR AN EXEMPTION DUE TO AN UNDERSIZED EXISTING WATER SERVICE
LINE, THE WATER SERVICE LINE MUST BE:

(1) APPROVED AND OWNED BY THE PUBLIC OR PRIVATE WATER SYSTEM
THAT OWNS THE MAINS.

(2) INSTALLED PRIOR TO MARCH 1, 2011.

(3) FULLY OPERATIONAL FROM THE PUBLIC OR PRIVATE WATER MAIN
TO A CURB STOP OR METER PIT LOCATED AT THE PROPERTY LINE.

(13) SUBSECTION R319.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

"R19.1 ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION. ADDRESS NUMBERS SHALL BE
PROVIDED ON NEW OR RENOVATED BUILDINGS AS REQUIRED BY THE
BEL AIR TOWN CODE CHAPTER 115."



(14)

(15)

(16)

)

(18)

19

20)

SUBSECTION R326.1 IS HEREBY DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS
INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF:

R326.1 GENERAL. ALL SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS SHALL
BE PROVIDED WITH BARRIER PROTECTION IN ACCORDANCE WITH
SECTION 305 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA
CODE. NO PROPERTY OWNER OR CONTRACTOR SHALL FILL A NEW
SWIMMING POOL OR SPA WITH WATER UNTIL A PERMANENT OR
TEMPORARY BARRIER HAS BEEN APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC WORKS. A TEMPORARY BARRIER MAY REMAIN IN PLACE FOR
NO MORE THAN 30 DAYS UNLESS APPROVED BY THE BUILDING

OFFICIAL.”

NEW SUBSECTION R326.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“R326.2 SUCTION ENTRAPMENT AVOIDANCE. ALL SWIMMING POOLS,
SPAS AND HOT TUBS SHALL BE PROVIDED IN ACCORDANCE WITH
SECTION 310 OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL AND SPA

CODE.”

SUBSECTION R405.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE EXCEPTION AT THE
END OF THE SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION R506.2.2 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE EXCEPTION AT THE
END OF THE SUBSECTION.

NEW SUBSECTION R703.9.3 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

R703.9.3 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS. SPECIAL INSPECTIONS SHALL BE
REQUIRED FOR ALL EIFS (EXTERIOR INSULATION FINISH SYSTEM)
APPLICATIONS.

EXCEPTIONS:

(1) SPECIAL INSPECTIONS SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED FOR EIFS
APPLICATIONS INSTALLED OVER A WATER-RESISTIVE BARRIER
WITH A MEANS OF DRAINING MOISTURE TO THE EXTERIOR.

(2) SPECIAL INSPECTIONS SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED FOR EIFS
APPLICATIONS INSTALLED OVER MASONRY OR CONCRETE
WALLS.

NEW SUBSECTION R903.4.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

"R903.4.2 GUTTERS AND LEADERS. GUTTERS AND LEADERS SHALL BE
INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE TOWN OF BEL AIR PLUMBING
CODE. ALL RAIN LEADERS OR EXTENSIONS SHALL NOT DISCHARGE
CLOSER THAN 10 FEET TO ANY LOT LINE SO AS NOT TO BE A NUISANCE
TO SURROUNDING PROPERTIES."

SUBSECTION N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE
FOLLOWING AT THE END OF THE SUBSECTION:

“EXCEPT AS PROVIDED FOR IN THE:

)

SIMULATED PERFORMANCE PATH LISTED IN SUBSECTION
N1105 (R405); AND



1)

22)

23)

24

25)

(I) ENERGY RATING INDEX COMPLIANCE ALTERNATIVE IN
SUBSECTION N1106 (R406).”

(TABLE N1105.5.2(1) (R405.5.2(1)) IS AMENDED BY ADDING “NOT TO
EXCEED 5 AIR CHANGES PER HOUR WITH BASELINE OF 3 AIR CHANGES
PER HOUR IN CLIMATE ZONES 4 AND S MAINTAINED FOR STANDARD
REFERENCE DESIGN” AFTER “THE MEASURED AIR EXCHANGE RATE”
UNDER THE “PROPOSED DESIGN”.

SUBSECTION N1106.2 (R406.2) IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING AT
THE END OF THE PARAGRAPH:

“EXCEPTION: THE MAXIMUM OF 5 AIR CHANGES PER HOUR TESTED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH SUBSECTION R402.4.1.2 MAY BE USED TO
DETERMINE THE ENERGY RATING INDEX SCORE WITH BASELINE OF 3
AIR CHANGES PER HOUR IN CLIMATE ZONES 4 AND S MAINTAINED FOR
ERI REFERENCE DESIGN.”

PART VII, CHAPTERS 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32 AND 33 ARE DELETED AND
TOWN OF BEL AIR CHPATER 353 PLUMBING AND GAS FITTING STANDARDS
IS INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF EXCEPT FOR SUBSECTION P2904,
DWELLING UNIT FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS, WHICH SHALL REMAIN AS
PART OF THIS CODE.

PART VIII, CHAPTERS, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 41, AND 43 ARE DELETED AND THE
TOWN OF BEL AIR CHAPTER 180 ELECTRICAL STAMDARDS IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF.

SUBSECTION AE101.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE SENTENCE "THESE
PROVISIONS SHALL BE APPLICABLE ONLY TO A MANUFACTURED HOME
USED AS A SINGLE DWELLING UNIT INSTALLED ON PRIVATELY OWNED
(NON-RENTAL) LOTS AND SHALL APPLY TO THE FOLLOWING:" AND
INSERTING THE FOLLOWING SENTENCE IN LIEU THEREOF: "THESE
PROVISIONS SHALL BE APPLICABLE ONLY TO A MANUFACTURED HOME
USED AS A SINGLE DWELLING UNIT INSTALLED ON PRIVATE AND RENTAL
LOTS AND SHALL APPLY TO THE FOLLOWING."

SUBSECTION AE201.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE DEFINITION OF
"MANUFACTURED HOME" AND INSERTING THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU
THEREOF:

MANUFACTURED HOME: MANUFACTURED HOME MEANS A
STRUCTURE, TRANSPORTABLE IN ONE OR MORE SECTIONS, WHICH IN
THE TRAVELING MODE IS 8 BODY FEET OR MORE IN WIDTH OR 40
BODY FEET OR MORE IN LENGTH OR, WHEN ERECTED ON SITE, IS 320
OR MORE SQUARE FEET AND WHICH IS BUILT ON A PERMANENT
CHASSIS AND DESIGNED TO BE USED AS A DWELLING WITH OR
WITHOUT A PERMANENT FOUNDATION WHEN CONNECTED TO THE
REQUIRED UTILITIES, AND INCLUDES THE PLUMBING, HEATING, AIR-
CONDITIONING AND ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS CONTAINED THEREIN.
CALCULATIONS USED TO DETERMINE THE NUMBER OF SQUARE FEET
IN A STRUCTURE WILL BE BASED ON THE STRUCTURE'S EXTERIOR
DIMENSIONS MEASURED AT THE LARGEST HORIZONTAL PROJECTIONS



(26)

27)

(28)

29)
(30)

WHEN ERECTED ON SITE. THESE DIMENSIONS WILL INCLUDE ALL
EXPANDABLE ROOM, CABINETS AND OTHER PROJECTIONS
CONTAINING INTERIOR SPACES BUT DO NOT INCLUDE BAY WINDOWS.
THIS TERM INCLUDES ALL STRUCTURES WHICH MEET THE ABOVE
REQUIREMENTS EXCEPT THE SIZE REQUIREMENTS AND WITH
RESPECT TO WHICH THE MANUFACTURER VOLUNTARILY FILES A
CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO SUBSECTION 3282.13 AND COMPLIES
WITH THE STANDARDS SET FORTH IN PART 3280.

NOTE: FOR MOBILE HOMES BUILT PRIOR TO JUNE 15,1976, A LABEL
CERTIFYING COMPLIANCE WITH THE STANDARD FOR MOBILE HOMES,
NFPA 501, ANSI 119.1, IN EFFECT AT THE TIME OF MANUFACTURE IS
REQUIRED. FOR THE PURPOSE OF THESE PROVISIONS, A MOBILE HOME
SHALL BE CONSIDERED A MANUFACTURED HOME.

SUBSECTION AE201.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE DEFINITION OF
"PRIVATELY OWNED (NON-RENTAL) LOT" AND INSERTING THE
FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF:

"PRIVATELY OWNED (NON-RENTAL) LOT. A PARCEL OF REAL ESTATE
OUTSIDE OF A MANUFACTURED HOME RENTAL COMMUNITY (PARK)
WHERE THE LAND AND THE MANUFACTURED HOME TO BE INSTALLED
THEREON ARE HELD IN COMMON OWNERSHIP."”

SUBSECTION AE201.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING
DEFINITION:

"RENTAL LOT. A LOT OR SPACE THAT IS RENTED IN AN APPROVED
MANUFACTURED HOME COMMUNITY OR PARK."

SUBSECTION AE201.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING
DEFINITION:

"INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING. AS DEFINED BY § 12-301(D) OF THE
PUBLIC SAFETY ARTICLE OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND,
'INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING' MEANS A BUILDING ASSEMBLY OR
SYSTEM OF BUILDING SUBASSEMBLIES MANUFACTURED IN ITS
ENTIRETY, OR IN SUBSTANTIAL PART, OFF SITE AND TRANSPORTED TO
THE POINT OF USE FOR INSTALLATION OR ERECTION, WITH OR
WITHOUT OTHER SPECIFIED COMPONENTS, AS A FINISHED BUILDING
OR AS A PART OF A FINISHED BUILDING COMPRISING TWO OR MORE
INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING UNITS. AN INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING
NEED NOT HAVE ELECTRICAL, PLUMBING, HEATING, VENTILATING,
INSULATION OR OTHER SERVICE SYSTEMS, BUT WHEN SUCH SYSTEMS
ARE INSTALLED AT THE OFF-SITE MANUFACTURE OR ASSEMBLY
POINT THEY SHALL BE DEEMED A PART OF SUCH BUILDING ASSEMBLY
OR SYSTEM OF BUILDING ASSEMBLIES. 'INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING'
DOES NOT INCLUDE OPEN FRAME CONSTRUCTION, WHICH CAN BE
COMPLETELY INSPECTED ON SITE. 'INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING' DOES
NOT INCLUDE A MOBILE HOME."

SECTION AE301 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.
SECTION AE302 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.



(1)
(32)
(33)

SECTION AE303 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.
SECTION AE304 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SUBSECTION AE602.1 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE PHRASE "OR ANSI
A225.1-1994" IN THE LAST LINE OF THE LAST PARAGRAPH AFTER THE
WORD "DESIGNER."

§145-9 Adoption of 2018 International Mechanical Code by reference.

The 2018 International Mechanical Code published by the International Code Council, Inc., is
hereby adopted and by reference thereto is made a part of this chapter with the same force and effect
as though set out in full herein, save and except such changes, amendments, revisions, deletions,
subsections and/or additions as specified in this chapter. If conflicts with this code, or with changes,
amendments, revisions, deletions, subsections and/or additions to that code are found elsewhere in
the Town Code, the most restrictive provisions shall govern.

(D

)

€)

(4)

)

(6)

Registration.

All persons that intend to install, maintain, alter, remodel or repair heating systems, cooling
systems, refrigeration systems, ventilation systems or hydronic systems in Harford County
shall be registered with the Division of Plumbing Services and shall have a current certificate
of registration.

To obtain a certificate of registration, the applicant shall have been qualified and approved by
the State of Maryland Board of Heating, Ventilation, Air Conditioning and Refrigeration
Contractors.

Master, master restricted, limited heating, ventilation, air-conditioning and refrigeration
certificate of registration. Any applicant who applies for a master, master restricted or a
limited heating, ventilation, air-conditioning and refrigeration services shall provide the
following information:

a) A current license number issued by the State of Maryland Board of Heating,
Ventilation, Air Conditioning and Refrigeration Contractors.

b) A current business address with phone number.

c) A current certificate of insurance equal to or greater than such amount as required by
the State of Maryland Board of Heating, Ventilation, Air Conditioning and
Refrigeration Contractors.

Journeyman, apprentice certificate of registration. Any applicant who applies for a
journeyman or apprentice certificate to assist in performing mechanical services shall provide
a current license number issued by the State of Maryland Board of Heating, Ventilation, Air
Conditioning and Refrigeration Contractors.

Fees for certificate of registration shall be as set forth in Chapter 157 of the Harford County
Code, as amended.

Master, master restricted and limited heating, ventilation, air-conditioning and refrigeration
certificates issued pursuant to this section shall expire on April 30 of each even-numbered



(7

®)

€

(10)

year, and all such certificates shall be issued for a 2-year period. All journeyman and
apprentice certificates issued pursuant to this section shall expire on October 31 of each
even-numbered year.

The administrative authority may, in its discretion, suspend or revoke the certificate of
registration of any person who makes any false or misleading statement in an application;
who sells, lends or otherwise permits any improper use of a certificate, obtains permits for
others to install, maintain, alter, remodel or repair heating systems, cooling systems,
refrigeration systems, ventilation systems or hydronic systems, loses or has been suspended
from his or her State of Maryland Board of Heating, Ventilation, Air Conditioning and
Refrigeration Contractors’ qualification or who commits any violation of the Harford County
Mechanical Code

Upon receipt of written requests directed to the administrative authority, the administrative
authority, in its discretion, may suspend or revoke the certificate of any person who commits
any violation of the Harford County Mechanical Code or any other law or regulation
governing the conduct to provide heating, ventilation, air-conditioning or refrigeration
services.

a)  No certificate shall be suspended or revoked except after a hearing before the
administrative authority of which the certificate holder shall receive at least 5 days’
notice, in writing, together with a statement of the charges. Upon such hearing, the
administrative authority may suspend any certificate for such a period of time as it may
find proper or may revoke same.

b) Inthe event of a revocation, no application for the reinstatement of a revoked
certificate shall be entertained until the expiration of 6 months from the date of such
revocation. At the end of such 6-month period, the administrative authority may, in its
discretion, reinstate a revoked certificate.

Any certificate holder shall notify the administrative authority immediately of any changes in
location of business, employer, phone number, licensing status or insurance coverage.

Any certificate of insurance required to be submitted under this section shall provide that in
the event the insurance required under this chapter is cancelled, the insurer shall notify the
Harford County Division of Plumbing Services within 10 days after the date of cancellation.

B.  Permit applicants.

(D

2

No work regulated by this code shall be commenced without a permit being issued by the
Department of Inspections, Licenses and Permits. Only to the extent that a registrant with
the Department of Inspections, Licenses and Permits is authorized to do work, shall a
registered master, master restricted, limited heating, ventilation, air-conditioning and
refrigeration contractor be eligible to apply for permits authorized by this code.

A mechanical permit issued in accordance with this Code may be issued to the owner of a
single-family dwelling occupied exclusively by the owner upon the following conditions:

a)  All work must be done in accordance with this code.

b)  The owner shall be tested and qualified by the Department of Inspections, Licenses and
Permits in accordance with requirements established by the Mechanical Board.



¢)  The owner shall sign an affidavit agreeing to comply with all applicable provisions of
this chapter and attesting that the location in which the work will be performed is the
applicant’s primary residence.

C. The following sections are changes or additions to certain sections of the 2015 International
Mechanical Code:

1) DEFINITIONS:

a) AS USED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “CODE OFFICIAL” MEANS THE
DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS OR HIS/HER DESIGNEE.

b) AS USED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “DEPARTMENT OF MECHANICAL
INSPECTION” MEANS THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES
AND PERMITS.

¢) ASUSED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE” MEANS THE TOWN OF BEL AIR PLUMBING AND GAS FITTING
STANDARDS, AS AMENDED.

d) AS USED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING
CODE” MEANS TOWN OF BEL AIR PLUMBING AND GAS FITTING
STANDARDS, AS AMENDED.

2) SUBSECTION 101.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “[NAME OF JURISDICTION]”
AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF “TOWN OF BEL AIR, MARYLAND”.

&) SUBSECTION 101.2.1 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN
LIEU THEREOF:

“101.2.1 APPENDICES. PROVISIONS IN APPENDIX A, COMBUSTION AIR
OPENINGS AND CHIMNEY CONNECTOR PASS-THROUGHS, SHALL BE
DEEMED AS PART OF THIS CODE.”

“ SECTION 103.1 IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.

3) SUBSECTION 106.2 IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING: “9. REPAIR,
SERVICE AND MAINTENANCE OF EXISTING EQUIPMENT.”

) SUBSECTION 106.3 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “IN WRITING OR
ELECTRONICALLY” AFTER THE WORD “FURNISHED” IN THE THIRD LINE
AND BY ADDING “ONLY AN INDIVIDUAL REGISTERED IN ACCORDANCE
WITH § 145-9A OF THIS ARTICLE SHALL BE ELIGIBLE TO MAKE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DO WORK IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS
CODE.”

) SUBSECTION 106.3.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “BY A REGISTERED DESIGN
PROFESSIONAL WHERE REQUIRED BY STATE LAW?” IN THE SIXTH LINE
AND INSERTING “IN ACCORDANCE WITH §145-9A” IN LIEU THEREOF AND
BY DELETING “BY A REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL” IN THE NINTH
LINE AND INSERTING “IN ACCORDANCE WITH §145-9A” IN LIEU THEREOF.

(8) NEW SUBSECTION 106.3.1.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
“106.3.1.1 PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS.



a) PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE INSTALLATION OF ALL
HEATING, VENTILATION, AIR-CONDITIONING OR REFRIGERATION
SYSTEMS SHALL:

1. BE APPROVED BY A LICENSED MARYLAND HVACR MASTER,
HVACR MASTER RESTRICTED LICENSED FOR THE SYSTEM
BEING INSTALLED, OR A MARYLAND LICENSED
PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER OR ARCHITECT; AND

2. HAVE AFFIXED TO THEM THE NAME AND LICENSE NUMBER
OF THE MARYLAND HVACR MASTER, HVACR MASTER
RESTRICTED LICENSED FOR THE SYSTEM BEING INSTALLED,
OR MARYLAND LICENSED PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER OR
ARCHITECT.

b) FOR INSTALLATIONS OTHER THAN ONE-FAMILY AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS, ADEQUATE DETAILS OF MECHANICAL AND
ELECTRICAL WORK, INCLUDING COMPUTATIONS, DIAGRAMS AND
OTHER ESSENTIAL TECHNICAL DATA, SHALL BE FILED. ALL
ENGINEERING PLANS AND COMPUTATIONS SHALL BEAR THE
SIGNATURE AND LICENSE NUMBER OF THE LICENSED ENGINEER,
ARCHITECT OR MECHANICAL LICENSEE RESPONSIBLE FOR THE
DESIGN. FOR ONE-FAMILY AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, A
RESIDENTIAL HEAT GAIN AND LOSS LOAD CALCULATION (FOR
EXAMPLE, A MANUAL J EVALUATION OR EQUIVALENT SUPPORTING
DOCUMENTATION ACCEPTABLE TO THE DEPARTMENT) SHALL BE
FILED FOR NEW INSTALLATIONS AT THE TIME OF PERMIT
APPLICATION. FOR REPLACEMENT OF A CONDENSING UNIT, AIR-
HANDLING UNIT, FURNACE OR BOILER IN AN EXISTING HVACR
SYSTEM IN ONE-FAMILY AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS THE
PERMIT APPLICATION SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED WITH
DOCUMENTATION REFLECTING CALCULATIONS BY WHICH THE
SIZING OF THE EQUIPMENT TO BE INSTALLED WAS DETERMINED. A
SIGNED AND DATED COPY OF THIS DOCUMENT SHALL BE RETAINED
BY THE CONTRACTOR, AND A COPY SHALL BE LEFT WITH THE
HOMEOWNER UPON COMPLETION OF THE WORK. PLANS SHALL
INDICATE HOW REQUIRED STRUCTURAL AND FIRE RESISTANCE
RATING INTEGRITY WILL BE MAINTAINED AND WHERE
PENETRATIONS WILL BE MADE FOR ELECTRICAL, MECHANICAL,
PLUMBING AND COMMUNICATION CONDUCTS, PIPES AND
SYSTEMS.”

C)] NEW SUBSECTION 106.3.4 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“106.3.4 APPLICANTS. ONLY AN INDIVIDUAL REGISTERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THIS §145-9A SHALL BE ELIGIBLE TO MAKE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DO WORK IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS
CODE.”

(10) SUBSECTION 106.4.3 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “180 DAYS” IN THE FOURTH
LINE AND INSERTING “12 MONTHS” IN LIEU THEREOF.



(11) NEW SUBSECTION 106.4.5.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“106.4.5.1 WITHHOLDING PERMITS. THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY
WITHHOLD THE ISSUANCE OF ANY PERMIT AND/OR PLACE A HOLD ON
INSPECTIONS IF THE APPLICANT, THE OWNER OR ANY INDIVIDUAL
LISTED ON THE APPLICATION AS A RESPONSIBLE OFFICER (IF THE
APPLICANT IS A BUSINESS ENTITY) HAS FAILED TO REMEDY OR
CORRECT ANY EXISTING/ALLEGED VIOLATION OF THE BUILDING
CODE ON ANY CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS FOR WHICH THE APPLICANT
HAS BEEN CITED.”

(12) SUBSECTION 108.4 IS AMENDED BY DELETING "[SPECIFY OFFENSE]
PUNISHABLE BY A FINE OF NOT MORE THAN [AMOUNT] DOLLARS OR BY
IMPRISONMENT NOT EXCEEDING [NUMBER OF DAYS], OR BOTH SUCH
FINE AND IMPRISONMENT.” AND REPLACING WITH “MISDEMEANOR,
PUNISHABLE AS PROVIDED IN CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE II OF THE BEL AIR
TOWN CODE.”

(13) SUBSECTION 108.5 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “ANY PERSON WHO SHALL
CONTINUE ANY WORK ON THE SYSTEM AFTER HAVING BEEN SERVED
WITH A STOP WORK ORDER, EXCEPT SUCH WORK AS THAT PERSON IS
DIRECTED TO PERFORM TO REMOVE A VIOLATION OR UNSAFE
CONDITION, SHALL BE LIABLE FOR A FINE OF NOT LESS THAN [AMOUNT]
DOLLARS OR MORE THAN [AMOUNT] DOLLARS” AND REPLACING WITH
“MISDEMEANOR, PUNISHABLE AS PROVIDED IN CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE II OF
THE BEL AIR TOWN CODE.”

(14) SUBSECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE
FOLLOWING DEFINITION BETWEEN THE DEFINITIONS OF “REGISTERED
DESIGN PROFESSIONAL” AND “RETURN AIR”:

“REPAIR. TO PUT BACK IN GOOD CONDITION, FIX, TO RENEW PARTS, TO
MAKE EXISTING SYSTEMS FUNCTION. ANYTHING THAT CAN BE MADE TO
WORK IS REPAIRABLE. THE REPLACEMENT OF A SYSTEM OR A
CONDENSER UNIT, AIR-HANDLING UNIT, FURNACE OR BOILER WHICH
MAKE UP A SYSTEM SHALL CONSTITUTE ALTERING OR REMODELING,
NOT REPAIR.”

(15) SUBSECTION 301.11 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “TEMPORARY REPAIRS MAY
NOT BE MADE TO A DAMAGED HEAT EXCHANGER.” AT THE END OF THIS
SUBSECTION.

§145-9 Adoption of 2018 International Mechanical Code by reference.

This chapter shall not apply to buildings for which a valid building permit was applied for prior
to the date of adoption of this chapter.



AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Board of Town Commissioners that
this ordinance shall become effective on, 2021.

INTRODUCTION:
PUBLIC HEARING:
ENACTMENT:
EFFECTIVE:

AYES:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

Amy G. Chmielewski, Chair

Board of Town Commissioners






