ORDINANCE NO. 799-21

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND the Code of the Town of Bel Air by deleting and repealing
Chapter 353 thereof, Plumbing and Gas Fitting Standards, and replacing it with a new Chapter
353 to be entitled Plumbing and Gas Fitting Standards, which chapter provides for the
establishment of standards and safeguards for the proper design, acceptable installation and
adequate maintenance of plumbing and fuel-operated systems within the Town of Bel Air,
permits and the fixing of penalties and fees for violation of the chapter.

BE IT ENACTED by the Board of Town Commissioners as follows:

Section 1.
The Code of the Town of Bel Air is hereby amended by deleting and repealing Chapter 353,
Plumbing and Gas Fitting Standards.

Section 2.

The Code of the Town of Bel Air is hereby amended by adding thereto a new chapter, to
replace Chapter 353 hereinabove repealed, to be Chapter 353, Plumbing and Gas Fitting
Standards to read as follows:

§353-1 Adoption of Plumbing Code and Fuel Gas Code.
§353-2 Purpose.

§353-3 Scope and applicability.

§353-4 Modifications.

§353-5 Certificate of Registration.

§353-6 Adoption of county regulations.

§353-7 Piping through adjacent property.

§353-8 Water conservation.

§353-9 Violations and penalties.

§ 353-1. Adoption of Plumbing Code and Fuel Gas Code.

For the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the proper design, acceptable installation
and adequate maintenance of plumbing and fuel-operated systems within the Town of Bel Air,
permits and the fixing of penalties and fees, the Town of Bel Air hereby adopts the 2018
International Plumbing Code, the 2018 International Fuel Gas Code, published by the
International Code Council and the American Gas Association and the section of the 2018
International residential code, saving and excepting such portions as are deleted, modified or
amended by this chapter, and the same are hereby adopted and made part of this chapter with the
same force and effect as though set forth in full herein. A copy of the Plumbing Code and
supplements thereto are on file with the Town of Bel Air and open for public use, examination,
and inspection.

§ 353-2. Purpose.

The purpose of this chapter is to provide practical plumbing and gas fitting REQUIREMENTS
to safeguard persons and gas fitting conditions in the Town of Bel Air.



§ 353-3. Scope and applicability.

The provisions of this chapter shall apply to and govern plumbing and gas fitting WORK
PERFORMED IN THE TOWN OF BEL AIR AND ARE DESIGNED to safeguard persons
and PROPERTY in the Town of Bel Air.

§ 353-4. Modifications.

A.

B.

Definitions. As used in this Code, the term "authority having jurisdiction" means the
Town of Bel Air, Director of Public Works.
The following sections are changes or additions to certain sections of the 2018

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE.

)

)
@)

“)

®)
(6)

)

SUBSECTION 101.1, TITLE, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY SUBSTITUTING
THE WORDS "TOWN OF BEL AIR" FOR THE WORDS "NAME OF
JURISDICTION".

SUBSECTION 103.1, GENERAL, IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SUBSECTION 103.2, APPOINTMENT, IS AMENDED BY ADDING “AND
THE DEPUTY DIRECTOR” AFTER THE WORD “OFFICIAL” IN THE
FIRST LINE.

SUBSECTION 103.3, IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY
SUBSECTION 103.4, IS DELETED IN ITS ENTIRETY

SUBSECTION 106.3, APPLICATION FOR PERMIT, IS HEREBY AMENDED
BY ADDING "WHO SHALL MEET WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF § 202-
5 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING CODE" AFTER THE WORD
"AGENT" IN THE SIXTH LINE.

SUBSECTION 105.2, ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, DESIGN AND
METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION AND EQUIPMENT, IS DELETED AND
THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF:

“105.2 ALTERNATIVE MATERIALS, METHODS AND EQUIPMENT.
THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE ARE NOT INTENDED TO
PREVENT THE INSTALLATION OF ANY MATERIAL OR TO
PROHIBIT ANY METHOD OF CONSTRUCTION NOT SPECIFICALLY
PRESCRIBED BY THIS CODE, PROVIDED THAT ANY SUCH
ALTERNATIVE HAS BEEN APPROVED. AN ALTERNATIVE
MATERIAL OR METHOD OF CONSTRUCTION SHALL BE
APPROVED WHERE THE CODE OFFICIAL FINDS THAT THE
PROPOSED ALTERNATIVE MATERIAL, METHOD OR EQUIPMENT
COMPLIES WITH THE INTENT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE



®

®

(10)

an

(12)

AND IS NOT LESS THAN THE EQUIVALENT OF THAT PRESCRIBED
IN THIS CODE. WHERE THE ALTERNATIVE MATERIAL, DESIGN
OR METHOD OF CONSTRUCTION IS NOT APPROVED, THE CODE
OFFICIAL SHALL RESPOND IN WRITING, STATING THE REASONS
WHY THE ALTERNATIVE WAS NOT APPROVED.”

SUBSECTIONS 106.1.1, ANNUAL PERMIT, AND 106.1.2, ANNUAL PERMIT
RECORDS, ARE DELETED IN THEIR ENTIRETY.

SUBSECTION 106.3, APPLICATION FOR PERMIT, IS {HEREBY]
AMENDED BY ADDING “IN WRITING OR ELECTRONICALLY” AFTER
THE WORD “FURNISHED” IN THE THIRD LINE AND BY ADDING “WHO
SHALL MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF § 202-5[A] OF THIS CHAPTER”
AFTER THE WORD “AGENT” IN THE SIXTH LINE.

SUBSECTION 106.3.1, CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS, IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY ADDING "ALL PLANS SHALL BE PREPARED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH § 202-7 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING
CODE" IN THE FOURTH LINE AFTER "FOR A PERMIT."

NEW SUBSECTION 106.3.4 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

'"106.3.4 EMERGENCY WORK. WHEN WORK OF AN EMERGENCY
NATURE, OTHER THAN SEWAGE DISPOSAL WORK, MUST BE
PERFORMED TO RECTIFY A CONDITION THAT IS POTENTIALLY
UNSANITARY OR HAZARDOUS TO LIFE, HEALTH OR PROPERTY,
THE MASTER PLUMBER, MASTER NATURAL GAS FITTER, WATER
PUMP CONTRACTOR OR ON-SITE CONTRACTOR, AS THE CASE
MAY BE, MAY UNDERTAKE SUCH WORK PRIOR TO THE ISSUANCE
OF A PERMIT, BUT HE OR SHE SHALL NOTIFY THE AUTHORITY
HAVING JURISDICTION OVER THE EMERGENCY AND SHALL
OBTAIN A PERMIT FOR SUCH WORK WITHIN 48 HOURS OF THE
COMMENCEMENT OF THE WORK"'.

SUBSECTION 106.5.3, EXPIRATION, IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING
IS INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF:

“106.5.3 EXPIRATION. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED BY THE CODE
OFFICIAL UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE SHALL EXPIRE
BY LIMITATION AND BECOME NULL AND VOID IF THE WORK
AUTHORIZED BY SUCH PERMIT IS NOT COMMENCED WITHIN 1
YEAR FROM THE DATE OF SUCH PERMIT, OR IF THE WORK
AUTHORIZED BY SUCH PERMIT IS SUSPENDED OR ABANDONED
AT ANY TIME AFTER THE WORK IS COMMENCED FOR A PERIOD
OF 180 DAYS.” SUBSECTION 106.5.3, EXPIRATION, IS HEREBY



13)

(14)

1s)

(16)

an

(18)

19)

AMENDED BY DELETING "180" IN THE FOURTH LINE AND
INSERTING, IN LIEU THEREOF, "'365".

SUBSECTION 106.5.4, EXTENSIONS, IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE
LAST TWO SENTENCES.

NEW SUBSECION 106.5.5.1 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“106.5.5.1 WITHHOLDING PERMITS. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL MAY
WITHHOLD THE ISSUANCE OF A PLUMBING OR FUEL GAS
PERMIT IF THE APPLICANT HAS FAILED TO REMEDY OR
CORRECT ANY VIOLATIONS OF THIS CODE ON ANY PREVIOUS
PERMITS WITHIN 90 CALENDAR DAYS FROM THE TIME FOR
WHICH THE APPLICANT HAS BEEN CITED BY THE DEPARTMENT
OF BUILDING SAFETY.”

SUBSECTION 106.5.7, PREVIOUS APPROVALS, IS AMENDED BY
DELETING THE LANGUAGE BEGINNING WITH THE ¢,” IN THE FIFTH
LINE DOWN THROUGH THE WORD “ABANDONED” IN THE SEVENTH
LINE.

SUBSECTION 106.6.1, WORK COMMENCING BEFORE PERMIT
ISSUANCE, IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE LANGUAGE BEGINNING
WITH “100” IN THE FOURTH LINE DOWN THROUGH THE WORD
“FEES” IN THE FIFTH LINE AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF “A FEE
ESTABLISHED BY THE CODE OFFICIAL THAT SHALL BE IN ADDITION
TO THE REQUIRED PERMIT FEES UNLESS WAIVED BY THE CODE
OFFICIAL PURSUANT TO ESTABLISHED POLICY”.

SUBSECTION 106.6.2 AND 106.6.3 ARE DELETED AND INSERT THE
FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF:

“106.6.2 FEE SCHEDULE. THE FEES FOR ALL PLUMBING AND FUEL
GAS WORK SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 157 OF
THE HARFORD COUNTY CODE, AS AMENDED.

“106.6.3 FEE REFUNDS. REFUNDS SHALL BE ADMINISTERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH CHAPTER 157 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY
CODE, AS AMENDED.”

SUBSECTION 108.1, UNLAWFUL ACTS, IS AMENDED BY ADDING “OR
FUEL GAS” AFTER THE WORD “PLUMBING” IN THE THIRD LINE.

SUBSECTION 108.4, VIOLATION PENALTIES, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
DELETING "[SPECIFY OFFENSE], PUNISHABLE BY A FINE OF NOT
MORE THAN [AMOUNT] DOLLARS OR BY IMPRISONMENT NOT



(20)

21

22)

(23)

(24)

25)

EXCEEDING [NUMBER OF DAYS], OR BOTH SUCH FINE AND
IMPRISONMENT." IN THE SEVENTH LINE AND INSERTING, IN LIEU
THEREOF, "AND REPLACING WITH “MISDEMEANOR, PUNISHABLE
AS PROVIDED IN CHAPTER 1, ARTICLE II OF THE BEL AIR TOWN
CODE.”

SUBSECTION 108.5, STOP WORK ORDERS, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
DELETING OF NOT THAN [AMOUNT] DOLLARS OR MORE THAN
[AMOUNT] DOLLARS” IN THE FOURTEENTH LINE AND INSERTING |[,
IN LIEU THEREOF, IN LIEU THEREOF, "AND REPLACING WITH
“MISDEMEANOR, PUNISHABLE AS PROVIDED IN CHAPTER 1,
ARTICLE II OF THE BEL AIR TOWN CODE.”

SUBSECTION 108.7, UNSAFE PLUMBING, IS AMENDED BY ADDING “OR
FUEL GAS” AFTER THE WORD “PLUMBING” IN THE TITLE ON THE
FIRST LINE, AND BY ADDING “OR FUEL GAS SYSTEM” AFTER THE
WORD “PLUMBING” IN THE FIRST LINE.

SUBSECTION 108.7.1, AUTHORITY TO CONDEMN EQUIPMENT, IS
AMENDED BY ADDING “OR FUEL GAS SYSTEM” AFTER THE WORD
“PLUMBING” IN THE SECOND LINE OF THE FIRST PARAGRAPH AND
IN THE FIRST LINE OF THE SECOND PARAGRAPH.

SUBSECTION 109.1, APPLICATION FOR APPEAL, IS [HEREBY]
AMENDED BY ADDING “[CREATED UNDER] AS ESTABLISHED IN
SECTION 113 OF CHAPTER 82 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY CODE”
AFTER “BOARD OF APPEALS” IN THE SECOND AND THIRD [AND
FOURTH] LINES.

SUBSECTION 109.2 THROUGH 109.7 ARE DELETED.

SECTION 202, GENERAL DEFINITIONS, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
DELETING THE DEFINITION OF "PLUMBING'" AND INSERTING THE
FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF:

"PLUMBING. THE PRACTICE, MATERIALS AND FIXTURES USED IN
THE INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE, EXTENSION, ALTERATION
AND REMOVAL OF ALL PIPING, PLUMBING FIXTURES, PLUMBING
APPLIANCES, AND PLUMBING APPURTENANCES IN CONNECTION
WITH ANY OF THE FOLLOWING: SANITARY DRAINAGE, STORM
FACILITIES, VENTING SYSTEMS, PUBLIC OR PRIVATE WATER
SUPPLY SYSTEMS, WITHIN OR ADJACENT TO ANY BUILDING
STRUCTURE OR CONVEYANCE; ALSO THE PRACTICE AND
MATERIALS USED IN THE INSTALLATION, MAINTENANCE,
EXTENSION, ALTERATION OR REMOVAL OF STORMWATER,
REFRIGERATION AND AIR CONDITIONING DRAINAGE, LIQUID



(26)

@7

WASTE OR SEWAGE, AND WATER SUPPLY, OF ANY PREMISES TO
THEIR CONNECTION WITH THE WATER SUPPLY SYSTEM OR TO
AN ACCEPTABLE DISPOSAL FACILITY. ‘PLUMBING’ ALSO MEANS
THE PRACTICE AND MATERIALS IN THE INSTALLATION, REPAIR,
SERVICE AND REPLACEMENT OF GAS PIPING, GAS UTILIZATION
EQUIPMENT, AND ASSOCIATED ACCESSORIES.

EXCEPT FOR THE INITIAL CONNECTION TO A POTABLE WATER
SUPPLY DOWNSTREAM OF THE BACKFLOW PREVENTER AND
THE FINAL CONNECTION THAT DISCHARGES INDIRECTLY INTO A
PUBLIC OR PRIVATE DISPOSAL SYSTEM, THE FOLLOWING ARE
EXCLUDED FROM THE DEFINITION: ALL PIPING, EQUIPMENT OR
MATERIAL USED EXCLUSIVELY FOR ENVIRONMENTAL
CONTROL, FOR INCORPORATION OF LIQUIDS OR GASES INTO
ANY PRODUCT OR PROCESS FOR USE IN THE MANUFACTURING
OR STORAGE OF ANY PRODUCT, INCLUDING PRODUCT
DEVELOPMENT, OR FOR THE INSTALLATION, ALTERATION,
REPAIR OR REMOVAL OF AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
INSTALLED FOR FIRE PROTECTION ONLY OR THEIR RELATED
APPURTENANCES OR STANDPIPES CONNECTED TO AUTOMATIC
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS OR OVERHEAD OR UNDERGROUND FIRE
LINES BEGINNING AT A POINT WHERE WATER IS USED
EXCLUSIVELY FOR FIRE PROTECTION."

SECTION 202, GENERAL DEFINITION, IS AMENDED BY ADDING THE
DEFINITION OF "PLUMBING BOARD" BETWEEN THE TERMS
"PLUMBING APPURTENANCE" AND "PLUMBING FIXTURE"

"PLUMBING BOARD. THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING BOARD
AS DEFINED IN §16-7 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING
CODE, AS AMENDED".

THE TERM “VENT STACK” TO READ AS FOLLOWS: “VENT STACK
PROVIDES POSITIVE PRESSURE RELIEF FROM THE BASE OF
INDIVIDUAL DRAIN STACKS HAVING 5 OR MORE BRANCH
INTERVALS.”.

SUBSECTION 301.3, CONNECTIONS TO DRAINAGE SYSTEM, IS
HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING TO THE END OF
THE SIXTH LINE:

"THE DRAINAGE SYSTEM OF ANY BUILDING IN WHICH
PLUMBING FIXTURES ARE INSTALLED SHALL BE CONNECTED TO
A PUBLIC SEWER SYSTEM IF THE PUBLIC SEWER SYSTEM IS
WITHIN 10 FEET OF ANY PROPERTY LINE OF THE PREMISES, OR
OTHER REASONABLE DISTANCE AS DETERMINED BY THE
AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION."



(28)

29)

(30)

@31

(32)

(33)

SUBSECTION 301.4, CONNECTIONS TO WATER SUPPLY, IS HEREBY
AMENDED BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING TO THE END OF THE FIFTH
LINE:

"THE WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM OF ANY BUILDING IN
WHICH PLUMBING FIXTURES ARE INSTALLED SHALL BE
CONNECTED TO A PUBLIC WATER SUPPLY SYSTEM IF THE
PUBLIC WATER SUPPLY SYSTEM IS WITHIN 10 FEET OF ANY
PROPERTY LINE OF THE PREMISES, OR OTHER REASONABLE
DISTANCE AS DETERMINED BY THE AUTHORITY HAVING
JURISDICTION."

NEW SUBSECTION 404.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""404.2 MARYLAND ACCESSIBILITY CODE. PLUMBING FIXTURES,
MATERIALS AND CLEARANCES FOR THOSE FIXTURES SHALL BE
ACCESSIBLE TO INDIVIDUALS WITH DISABILITIES AS SPECIFIED
IN THE MARYLAND ACCESSIBILITY CODE, COMAR 05.02.02, ET
SEQ."

NEW SUBSECTION 405.3.6 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""405.3.6 FAUCET INSTALLATIONS. FIBERGLASS OR PLASTIC TUB
AND SHOWER ENCLOSURES CANNOT BE INSTALLED WITH
FAUCETS BACK-TO-BACK UNLESS APPROVED BY THE
AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION."

SUBSECTION 504.6, REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCHARGE PIPING, IS
HEREBY AMENDED BY DELETING ITEM 5 AND INSERTING IN LIEU
THEREOF, "DISCHARGE TO A WASTE RECEPTOR OR TO THE
OUTDOORS."

SUBSECTION 504.7, REQUIRED PAN, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY ADDING
THE WORDS ", CLOTHES WASHING MACHINE" AFTER THE WORD
"HEATER" IN THE FIRST LINE.

NEW SUBSECTION 603.3 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

"604.8 WATER METERS. EACH DWELLING UNIT WHICH MEETS
THE DEFINITION OF A "DWELLING, CARRIAGE COURT"
CONTAINED IN § 267-4 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING
CODE, AS AMENDED, SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH A PRIVATE,
INDIVIDUAL WATER METER."



(34) NEW SUBSECTION 603.4 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“603.4 UNDERGROUND NON-METALLIC WATER SERVICE.
UNDERGROUND NON-METALLIC WATER SERVICE PIPING SHALL
BE MADE DETECTABLE BY THE INSTALLATION OF TRACER
WIRING THAT COMPLIES WITH PUBLIC UTILITIES ARTICLE, § 12-
129 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND. THE WIRE SHALL
BE AN INSULATED COPPER TRACER WIRE SUITABLE FOR DIRECT
BURIAL, AT LEAST 10 AWG, OR EQUIVALENT. INSULATION
SHALL BE 30 MIL MINIMUM THICKNESS, HMWPE OR HDPE
POLYETHYLENE, COLOR CODED BLUE. THE WIRE SHALL BE
INSTALLED IN THE SAME TRENCH AS THE PIPING, TIED OR
TAPED TO THE PIPE EVERY 5 TO 8 FEET IN THE 3 O’CLOCK
POSITION OR INSTALLED WITHIN 12 INCHES OF THE PIPE IN FILL.
ONE END OF THE WIRE SHALL TERMINATE WITHIN 5§ FEET OF
THE BUILDING SERVED, AT OR ABOVE GRADE, ACCESSIBLE FOR
USE, AND RESISTANT TO PHYSICAL DAMAGE. TRACER WIRING
INSTALLATIONS SHALL BE TESTED BY LOCATION WITH LINE
TRACING EQUIPMENT UPON COMPLETION OF ROUGH GRADING
AND AGAIN PRIOR TO FINAL ACCEPTANCE.”

(35) SUBSECTION 604.8 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED
IN LIEU THEREOF:

"604.8 WATER PRESSURE REDUCING VALVE OR REGULATOR.
WHEN CONNECTED TO A PUBLIC WATER SUPPLY SYSTEM, AN
APPROVED PRESSURE-REDUCING VALVE SHALL BE INSTALLED
IN THE BUILDING WATER SERVICE PIPE NEAR ITS POINT OF
ENTRANCE TO THE BUILDING. PRESSURE TO THE BUILDING
WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPING SHALL BE LIMITED TO A
MAXIMUM PRESSURE OF 80 P.S.I. UNDER NO-FLOW CONDITIONS.
THE WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPING SHALL BE RELIEVED OF
EXCESSIVE PRESSURE DUE TO THERMAL EXPANSION BY ONE OF
THE FOLLOWING METHODS:

1. AIR CHAMBERS WHEN EQUIPPED WITH AN ACCESSIBLE

MEANS RESTORING THE AIR.

2. APPROVED MECHANICAL DEVICES. PRESSURE AT ANY
FIXTURE SHALL BE LIMITED TO NO MORE THAN 80 P.S.IL.
UNDER NO-FLOW CONDITIONS.

EXCEPTIONS: WHERE THE WATER SERVICE PIPE SUPPLIES
WATER DIRECTLY TO:

1. A WATER PRESSURE BOOSTER SYSTEM: OR



2. AN ELEVATED WATER GRAVITY TANK; OR

3. PUMPS PROVIDED IN CONNECTION WITH A HYDRO
PNEUMATIC OR ELEVATED GRAVITY WATER SUPPLY TANK
SYSTEM."

(36) SUBSECTION 605.3 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED
IN LIEU THEREOF:

"605.3 WATER SERVICE PIPE. APPROVED WATER SERVICE PIPE
TO THE POINT OF THE ENTRANCE OF A BUILDING, INCLUDING
PIPING TO THE PRESSURE-REDUCING VALVE, SHALL HAVE A
MINIMUM PRESSURE RATING OF 200 P.S.1., 73°F. ACCEPTABLE
MATERIALS FOR A WATER SERVICE INCLUDE BRASS PIPE,
COPPER TUBE OR COPPER PIPE, CAST IRON WATER PIPE,
POLYETHYLENE PLASTIC TUBING AND CHLORINATED
POLYVINYL CHLORIDE SERVICE PIPE. COPPER TUBE OR COPPER
PIPE, WHEN USED UNDERGROUND, MAY NOT BE LESS THAN TYPE
L. ALL THREADED FERROUS PIPE AND FITTING SHALL BE
GALVANIZED OR CEMENT LINES AND, WHEN USED
UNDERGROUND IN CORROSIVE SOIL OR FILLED GROUND, SHALL
BE COAL TAR ENAMEL COATED, OR THE EQUIVALENT, AND
THREADED JOINTS SHALL BE COATED AND WRAPPED WHEN
INSTALLED."

(37) NEW SUBSECTION 605.3.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

"605.3.2 BACKFLOW PREVENTION ON COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES.
FOR A COMMERCIAL PROPERTY WITH MULTIPLE TENANTS, THE
WATER SERVICE FOR EACH TENANT SPACE SHALL BE SEPARATE
AND SHALL HAVE A TESTABLE BACKFLOW PREVENTER
INSTALLED."

(38) SUBSECTION 605.4 IS DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS INSERTED
IN LIEU THEREOF:

"605.4 WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE. WATER DISTRIBUTION PIPE
SHALL BE OF BRASS PIPE, COPPER TUBE OR COOPER PIPE,
GALVANIZED STEEL PIPE, POLYETHYLENE AND CHLORINATED
POLYVINYL PLASTIC WHEN APPROVED FOR HOT OR COLD USE.
COOPER TUBE OR COPPER PIPE, WHEN USED UNDERGROUND,
MAY NOT BE LESS THAN TYPE L AND, WHEN USED ABOVE
GROUND, MAY NOT BE LESS THAN TYPE M."



(39)

(40)

@n

(42)

(43)

(44)

SUBSECTION 605.5, FITTINGS, IS AMENDED BY ADDING “PUSH-FIT
JOINTS SHALL NOT BE INSTALLED BELOW GRADE.” AFTER THE
LAST SENTENCE IN THE SEVENTH LINE.

SUBSECTION 606.2, LOCATION OF SHUTOFF VALVES, IS AMENDED BY
ADDING “AND/OR HOSE BIB” AFTER THE WORD “SILLCOCK” IN
NUMBERED PARAGRAPH 2.

SUBSECTION 607.2, HOT OR TEMPERED WATER SUPPLY TO
FIXTURES, IS AMENDED BY DELETING “50” IN THE FOURTH LINE
AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF “75”.

SUBSECTION 607.3, THERMAL EXPANSION CONTROL, IS AMENDED
BY ADDING THE FOLLOWING AT THE END OF THE PARAGRAPH:
“EXCEPTION:

(1) INSTANTANEOUS WATER HEATERS.
(2) WELL SYSTEMS WITH WATER PRESSURE TANKS.”
NEW SUBSECTION 703.7 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“703.7 BUILDING SANITARY SEWER TRACER WIRING.
UNDERGROUND BUILDING SANITARY SEWER NON-METALLIC
PIPING SHALL BE MADE DETECTABLE BY THE INSTALLATION OF
TRACER WIRING THAT COMPLIES WITH PUBLIC UTILITIES
ARTICLE, SECTION 12-129 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF
MARYLAND. THE WIRE SHALL BE AN INSULATED COPPER
TRACER WIRE SUITABLE FOR DIRECT BURIAL, AT LEAST 10 AWG,
OR EQUIVALENT. INSULATION SHALL BE 30 MIL MINIMUM
THICKNESS, HMWPE OR HDPE POLYETHYLENE, COLOR CODED
GREEN. THE WIRE SHALL BE INSTALLED IN THE SAME TRENCH
AS THE PIPING, TIED OR TAPED TO THE PIPE EVERY 5 TO 8 FEET
IN THE 3 O°CLOCK POSITION OR INSTALLED WITHIN 12 INCHES
OF THE PIPE IN FILL. ONE END OF THE WIRE SHALL TERMINATE
WITHIN 5 FEET OF THE BUILDING SERVED, AT OR ABOVE GRADE,
ACCESSIBLE FOR USE, AND RESISTANT TO PHYSICAL DAMAGE.
TRACER WIRING INSTALLATIONS SHALL BE TESTED BY
LOCATION WITH LINE TRACING EQUIPMENT UPON COMPLETION
OF ROUGH GRADING AND AGAIN PRIOR TO FINAL ACCEPTANCE.”

TABLE 710.1(2) IS AMENDED BY DELETING NOTE “B.” AND INSERTING
IN LIEU THEREOF THE FOLLOWING:

“B. THE SIZE OF THE DRAIN STACK SHOULD BE MAINTAINED
FULL-SIZE TO ITS STACK VENT TO PROVIDE THE AIR



45)

(46)

“7)

(48)

(49)

(30)

(1)

(52)

($3)

ASSOCIATED WITH THE HIGH VELOCITY DRAIN FLOW THAT THE
VENT STACK IS RELIEVING AT ITS BASE.”

SUBSECTION 714.1, SEWAGE BACKFLOW, IS AMENDED BY ADDING
“OR PRIVATE” AFTER THE WORD “PUBLIC” IN THE FOURTH,
EIGHTH AND TWELFTH LINE.

SUBSECTION 904.3, VENT TERMINATION, IS AMENDED BY DELETING
“TO THE OPEN AIR OR TO A STACK-TYPE AIR ADMITTANCE VALVE
IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 918” IN THE SECOND AND THIRD
LINES.

SUBSECTION 918.3.1 IS DELETED.

SUBSECTION 918.3.2, STACK, IS AMENDED BY DELETING “OR STACK
VENTS” IN THE THIRD LINE.

SUBSECTION 918.8, PROHIBITED INSTALLATIONS, IS AMENDED BY
DELETING THE THIRD SENTENCE OF THE PARAGRAPH.

SUBSECTION 1002.4.1.4 IS DELETED.

SUBSECTION 1003.3.1, GREASE INTERCEPTORS AND AUTOMATIC
GREASE REMOVAL DEVICES REQUIRED, IS AMENDED BY ADDING,
PRIOR TO THE WORD "A" IN THE SECOND LINE, "EXCEPT IN
SPECIAL CASES AS DETERMINED BY THE AUTHORITY HAVING
JURISDICTION".

SUBSECTION 1003.3.1, GREASE INTERCEPTORS AND AUTOMATIC
GREASE REMOVAL DEVICES REQUIRED, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
INSERTING THE FOLLOWING SENTENCE AFTER "TO BE
DISCHARGED" IN THE FOURTEENTH LINE, "UPON REQUEST BY THE
AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION OR THE HARFORD COUNTY
HEALTH DEPARTMENT, THE OWNER OF THE ESTABLISHMENT
SHALL PROVIDE A COPY OF A PUMPING CONTRACT OR PUMPING
RECEIPTS FOR THE INTERCEPTOR. THE MINIMUM SIZE OF A
GREASE INTERCEPTOR SHALL BE 1,000 GALLONS. THE GREASE
INTERCEPTOR SHALL BE LOCATED OUTSIDE OF THE BUILDING
UNLESS OTHERWISE DETERMINED BY THE AUTHORITY HAVING
JURISDICTION. THE DISCHARGE FROM A COMMERCIAL
DISHWASHER SHALL NOT PASS THROUGH A GREASE INTERCEPTOR
UNLESS APPROVED BY THE AUTHORITY HAVING JURISDICTION."

SUBSECTION 1003.3.1, GREASE INTERCEPTORS AND AUTOMATIC
GREASE REMOVAL DEVICES REQUIRED, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY
INSERTING THE FOLLOWING SENTENCE AT THE END OF THE



4

CS)

SUBSECTION, "WHERE INSTALLED INSIDE BUILDING, A GREASE
INTERCEPTOR SHALL BE LOCATED IN A SEPARATE ROOM WHICH
HAS OUTSIDE ACCESS."

NEW SUBSECTION 1101.10 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

""1101.10 PARKING AND FUEL ISLAND STORM DRAINAGE. ON
PARKING LOTS, FUEL ISLANDS OR PARKING GARAGES WHERE
OIL WASTE PRODUCT IS SUBJECT TO MIXING WITH RAINWATER,
ICE AND MELTING SNOW, DRAINS FOR THE RUN OFF SHALL NOT
BE CONNECTED TO THE SANITARY SEWER. ANY STORMWATER
RUNOFF SHALL BE DRAINED SEPARATELY TO THE STORM
SEWER."

SUBSECTION 1202.1, NONFLAMMABLE MEDICAL GASES, IS AMENDED
BY DELETING NUMBERED EXCEPTION “2.”,

C. The following sections are changes or additions to certain sections of the 2015
International Fuel Gas Code.

M

@)

3)

Q)

S))

SUBSECTION 101.1, TITLE, IS HEREBY AMENDED BY SUBSTITUTING
THE WORDS "TOWN OF BEL AIR" FOR THE WORDS "[NAME OF
JURISDICTION]"

SUBSECTION 101.3, APPENDICES, IS HEREBY DELETED AND THE
FOLLOWING IS INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF:

"101.3 APPENDICES. THE PROVISIONS OF APPENDIX A, APPENDIX
B, APPENDIX C AND APPENDIX D ARE HEREBY ADOPTED AS PART
OF THIS CODE."

NEW SUBSECTION 102.12 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“102.12 ALTERNATIVE COMPLIANCE. WHEN APPROVED BY THE
DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS, GAS
INSTALLATIONS MAY COMPLY WITH NFPA 58.”

SECTIONS 103 THROUGH 110 ARE DELETED AND THE FOLLOWING IS
INSERTED IN LIEU THEREOF: “ADMINISTRATION OF THE 2018
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH
§ 202-10B (1) OF THIS CODE.”

SECTION 202 (IFGC), GENERAL DEFINITIONS, IS AMENDED BY
DELETING THE DEFINITION OF "CODE OFFICIAL" AND REPLACING
WITH THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF:



(6)

()

@)

®

"CODE OFFICIAL. THE DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS FOR THE
TOWN OF BEL AIR OR HIS/HER DESIGNEE."

SECTION 202 (IFGC), GENERAL DEFINITIONS, IS AMENDED BY
ADDING THE FOLLOWING DEFINITION OF "DEPARTMENT OF
INSPECTION" BETWEEN THE TERMS "DEMAND'" AND DESIGN
FLOOD ELEVATION";

"DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTION. THE HARFORD COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS."

SECTION 202 (IFGC), GENERAL DEFINITION, IS AMENDED BY
ADDING THE DEFINITION OF "PLUMBING BOARD'" BETWEEN THE
TERMS "PLUMBING APPURTENANCE'" AND "PLUMBING FIXTURE'";

"PLUMBING BOARD. THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING BOARD
AS DEFINED IN §16-7 OF THE HARFORD COUNTY PLUMBING
CODE, AS AMENDED".

SUBSECTION 310.1, PIPE AND TUBING OTHER THAN CSST, IS
AMENDED BY ADDING “FOR EXISTING GAS PIPING
INSTALLATIONS,” AT THE BEGINNING OF THE SECOND SENTENCE
BEFORE THE WORD “GAS”.

SUBSECTION 310.3, ARC-RESISTANT CSST, IS DELETED.

D. THE FOLLOWING SECIONS ARE CHANGES OR ADDITIONAS TO CERTAIN
SECTIOSN OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTAIL CODE:

Q)

@)

&)

)

THE FOLLOWING APPENDICES OF THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE ARE HEREBY ADOPTED: APPENDICES A
THROUGH 3, APPENDIX I AND APPENDIX P.

TABLE P2906.4, WATER SERVICE PIPE, IS AMENDED BY DELETING
“M” IN THE FIFTH LINE.

SUBSECTION P2906.4.1 IS AMENDED BY DELETING “S FEET” IN THE
EIGHTH AND TWELFTH LINES AND INSERTING IN LIEU THEREOF “12
INCHES”.

NEW SUBSECTION P2906.4.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“P2906.4.2 UNDERGROUND NON-METALLIC WATER SERVICE.
UNDERGROUND NON-METALLIC WATER SERVICE PIPING SHALL
BE MADE DETECTABLE BY THE INSTALLATION OF TRACER
WIRING THAT COMPLIES WITH PUBLIC UTILITIES ARTICLE, § 12-
129 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND. THE WIRE SHALL



BE AN INSULATED COPPER TRACER WIRE SUITABLE FOR DIRECT
BURIAL, AT LEAST 10 AWG, OR EQUIVALENT. INSULATION
SHALL BE 30 MIL MINIMUM THICKNESS, HMWPE OR HDPE
POLYETHYLENE, COLOR CODED BLUE. THE WIRE SHALL BE
INSTALLED IN THE SAME TRENCH AS THE PIPING, TIED OR
TAPED TO THE PIPE EVERY 5 TO 8 FEET IN THE 3 O’CLOCK
POSITION OR INSTALLED WITHIN 12 INCHES OF THE PIPE IN FILL.
ONE END OF THE WIRE SHALL TERMINATE WITHIN 5 FEET OF
THE BUILDING SERVED, AT OR ABOVE GRADE, ACCESSIBLE FOR
USE, AND RESISTANT TO PHYSICAL DAMAGE. TRACER WIRING
INSTALLATIONS SHALL BE TESTED BY LOCATION WITH LINE
TRACING EQUIPMENT UPON COMPLETION OF ROUGH GRADING
AND AGAIN PRIOR TO FINAL ACCEPTANCE.”

Q) SUBSECTION P2906.21 IS AMENDED BY ADDING “PUSH-FIT JOINTS
SHALL NOT BE INSTALLED BELOW GRADE.” AT THE END OF THE
SECTION.

6) NEW SUBSECTION P3002.2.2 IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

“P3002.2.2 BUILDING SANITARY SEWER TRACER WIRING.
UNDERGROUND BUILDING SANITARY SEWER NON-METALLIC
PIPING SHALL BE MADE DETECTABLE BY THE INSTALLATION OF
TRACER WIRING THAT COMPLIES WITH PUBLIC UTILITIES
ARTICLE, § 12-129 OF THE ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND.

THE WIRE SHALL BE AN INSULATED COPPER TRACER WIRE
SUITABLE FOR DIRECT BURIAL, AT LEAST 10 AWG, OR
EQUIVALENT. INSULATION SHALL BE 30 MIL MINIMUM
THICKNESS, HMWPE OR HDPE POLYETHYLENE, COLOR CODED
GREEN. THE WIRE SHALL BE INSTALLED IN THE SAME TRENCH
AS THE PIPING, TIED OR TAPED TO THE PIPE EVERY 5 TO 8 FEET
IN THE 3 O°’CLOCK POSITION OR INSTALLED WITHIN 12 INCHES
OF THE PIPE IN FILL. ONE END OF THE WIRE SHALL TERMINATE
WITHIN 5 FEET OF THE BUILDING SERVED, AT OR ABOVE GRADE,
ACCESSIBLE FOR USE, AND RESISTANT TO PHYSICAL DAMAGE.
TRACER WIRING INSTALLATIONS SHALL BE TESTED BY
LOCATION WITH LINE TRACING EQUIPMENT UPON COMPLETION
OF ROUGH GRADING AND AGAIN PRIOR TO FINAL ACCEPTANCE.”

@) SUBSECTION P3201.2.1.4 IS DELETED.

t)) SUBSECTION P3114.8 IS AMENDED BY DELETING THE FIRST
SENTENCE.

§ 353-5. Certificate of registration.



All persons performing plumbing or gas fitting services in the Town of Bel Air shall be
registered with the Harford County Division of Plumbing Services and certified in accordance
with § 202-4, CERTIFICATE OF REGISTRATION, of the Harford County Plumbing Code.

§ 353-6. Adoption of county regulations.

The following sections of the Harford County Plumbing Code are adopted by reference and shall
apply to plumbing and gas fitting services in the Town of Bel Air: § 202-5, Permit applicants,

§ 202-6, Change of registered contractors, § 202-7, Plans and specification, and § 202-8,
Inspection of plumbing, gas fitting and sewage disposal systems.

§ 353-7. Piping through adjacent property.

Sewer, water and gas piping shall not be connected or installed through a property other than the
property to be served except as provided herein. Plumbing or gas piping connections which
cannot be made except by the crossing of nonserviced property may, with the permission of the
Town of Bel Air, be carried through a right-of-way or easement across non-serviced property,
provided that:

A. All privileges of such right-of-way or easement is obtained by the property owner
desiring service, without any cost or liability to the Town of Bel Air; and

B. Such easement or right-of-way shall meet all applicable regulatory requirements of the
authority having jurisdiction; and

C. Such easement or right-of-way shall be granted and conveyed by plat and/or formal deed
recorded in the land records of Harford County.

§ 353-8. Water conservation.

A. Plumbing shall be designed and adjusted to use the minimum quantity of water consistent
with proper performance and cleaning and in conformity with the water conservation
requirements established in the Maryland State Plumbing Code.

B. Executive authority. The Board of Town Commissioners may institute measures to adopt
plans to increase the water supply of the Town of Bel Air and decrease consumption,
such as, but not limited to, requiring the use of fixtures as stated herein and requiring a
limited use of potable water for purposes other than for human consumption and use.

§ 353-9. Violations and penalties.

Any person, firm or corporation who or which individually, collectively or through others shall
construct, erect, alter or repair any plumbing, gas fitting or sewage disposal work in violation of
any provision of this chapter shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be subject to a penalty as
provided in Chapter 1, Article II, of this Code.



AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Board of Town Commissioners that this
ordinance shall become effective on, 2021.

INTRODUCTION:
PUBLIC HEARING:
ENACTMENT:
EFFECTIVE:
AYES:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

Amy G. Chmielewski, Chair

Board of Town Commissioners



