ORDINANCE NO. 800-21

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND the Code of the Town of Bel Air by deleting and repealing Chapter
180 thereof, Electrical Standards, and replacing it with a new Chapter 180 to be entitled
Electrical Standards, which chapter provides for the establishment of standards and safeguards
for the proper design, acceptable installation and adequate maintenance of electrical systems
within the Town of Bel Air, including but not limited to granting and revocation of permits and
the fixing of penalties and fees for violation of the chapter.

BE IT ENACTED by the Board of Town Commissioners as follows:

Section 1.
The Code of the Town of Bel Air is hereby amended by deleting and repealing Chapter
180, Electrical Standards.

Section 2.
The Code of the Town of Bel Air is hereby amended by adding thereto a new chapter
180, Electrical Standards, to read as follows:

§180-1 Adoption of Electrical Code.
§180-2 Purpose.

§180-3 Scope and Applicability.

§180-4 Amendments to Electrical Code.
§180-5 Adoption of County Regulations.
§180-6 Licensing and registration.
§180-7 Permit required.

§180-8 Inspections.

§180-9 Administration and enforcement.
§180-10 Right of entry.

§180-11 Violations and penalties.
§180-12 Emergency disconnections.
§180-13 Fees.

§ 180-1. Adoption of Electrical Code.

For the purpose of establishing rules and regulations for the proper design, acceptable
installation and adequate maintenance of electrical systems within the Town of Bel Air,
including but not limited to the granting and revocation of permits and the fixing of penalties
and fees, the Town of Bel Air hereby adopts the National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition,
including all annexes, as adopted by the National Fire Protection Association (Electrical Section),
saving and excepting such portions as are deleted, modified or amended by this chapter, and
the same is hereby adopted and made part of this chapter with the same force and effect as
though set in full herein.



§ 180-2. Purpose.

The purpose of this chapter is to provide practical electrical regulations to safeguard persons
and property from hazards arising from the use of electricity in the Town of Bel Air.

§ 180-3. Scope and Applicability.

The provisions of this chapter shall apply to and govern electrical regulations to safeguard
persons and electrical conditions within the Town of Bel Air.

§ 180-4. Amendments to Electrical Code.

The National Electrical Code, 2020 Edition, adopted by this chapter is amended and revised as
follows:

(1) DEFINITIONS.

A) AS USED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “BUILDING OFFICIAL” MEANS THE
DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND
PERMITS OR HIS/HER DESIGNEE.

B) AS USED IN THIS CODE, THE TERM “DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY”
MEANS THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS.

(2) IN SUBSECTION 110.14 OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), ADD THE
FOLLOWING SENTENCE TO THE END OF THE FIRST PARAGRAPH: “AN INHIBITOR SHALL
BE USED FOR THE TERMINATION OF ALL ALUMINUM CONDUCTORS.”

(3) ALUMINUM CONDUCTORS OF 6 AWG AND SMALLER ARE NOT PERMITTED.
(4) IN SUBSECTION 210.8:
A) “EXCEPTION 1: RECEPTACLES FOR SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS WITHIN DWELLING
UNITS ARE PERMITTED TO BE INSTALLED WITHOUT GFCI PROTECTION WHEN
A SINGLE RECEPTACLE IS UTILIZED.
B) “EXCEPTION 2: RECEPTACLES FOR REFRIGERATION ARE PERMITTED TO BE
INSTALLED WITHOUT GFCI PROTECTION WHEN A SINGLE RECEPTACLE IS
UTILIZED.”

(5) SUBSECTION 103.2, APPOINTMENT, IS AMENDED BY ADDING “AND THE DEPUTY
DIRECTOR” AFTER THE WORD “OFFICIAL” IN THE FIRST LINE.



(6) IN SUBSECTION 210.52(B)(1) AND 210.52(B)(2) DELETE THE WORD "TWO" IN THE FIRST
LINE AND INSERT THE WORD "THREE" IN LIEU THEREOF.

(7) IN SUBSECTION 210.52(B)(3) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), ADD THE
FOLLOWING SENTENCE AFTER “(1).” IN THE SIXTH LINE: “ADJACENT RECEPTACLES
SERVING THE COUNTERTOP SHALL BE ON ALTERNATING CIRCUITS.”

(8) SUBSECTION 230.85 OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020) IS DELETED IN ITS
ENTIRETY.

(9) IN SUBSECTION 240.21(B)(1) AND {B){2) ADD THE FOLLOWING EXCEPTION:

"EXCEPTION: IN METER ROOMS, THE CONDUCTORS WITHIN THE AUXILIARY GUTTER
THAT SUPPLIES THE METERS SHALL NOT COUNT AS PART OF THE TOTAL LENGTH."

(10)IN SUBSECTION 250.52(A)(5) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), DELETE
BOTH PARAGRAPHS (A) AND (B) BEGINNING IN THE FOURTH LINE AND ADD THE
FOLLOWING AFTER THE WORD “MATERIALS.” IN THE THIRD LINE: “ELECTRODES OF
RODS OF IRON OR STEEL ARE NOT PERMITTED. STAINLESS STEEL RODS, NONFERROUS
RODS, OR THEIR EQUIVALENT SHALL BE LISTED AND SHALL NOT BE LESS THAN 16 MM
(5/8 INCH) IN DIAMETER.”

(11) UNDER (B)(1) "FOR GAS PIPING SYSTEM(S), THE BONDING CONDUCTORS SHALL NOT
BE SMALLER THAN 6 AWG COPPER WIRE OR EQUIVALENT TO BE CONNECTED AT A
READILY ACCESSIBLE LOCATION EITHER OUTSIDE OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR
INSIDE NEAREST TO THE POINT OF ENTRANCE OF THE PIPING SYSTEM AND AHEAD OF
ANY CSST PIPING THAT MAY BE INSTALLED IN THE STRUCTURE.” IN SUBSECTION
250.104(B)(1) ADD THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE TO THE END OF THE SENTENCE: "FOR
OTHER THAN GAS PIPING SYSTEM(S)." UNDER (B)(1), ADD THE FOLLOWING
LANGUAGE: "FOR GAS PIPING SYSTEM(S), THE BONDING CONDUCTORS SHALL NOT BE
SMALLER THAN 6 AWG COPPER WIRE OR EQUIVALENT TO BE CONNECTED AT A
READILY ACCESSIBLE LOCATION EITHER OUTSIDE OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE OR
INSIDE NEAREST TO THE POINT OF ENTRANCE OF THE PIPING SYSTEM AND AHEAD OF
ANY CSST PIPING THAT MAY BE INSTALLED IN THE STRUCTURE."

(12)IN SUBSECTION 310.3 OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020) DELETE “12” IN THE
THIRD LINE AND INSERT “4” IN LIEU THEREOF AND ADD “12 AWG” BETWEEN THE
WORDS “OR” AND “COPPER-CLAD” IN THE SAME LINE.

(13) IN SUBSECTION 410.36(B) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), DELETE THE
ENTIRE SUBSECTION AFTER THE WORD “CEILINGS.” IN THE TITLE AND INSERT THE
FOLLOWING IN LIEU THEREOF:



“ALL ‘LAY-IN’ LUMINAIRES REQUIRE INDEPENDENT SUSPENSION TO ENSURE
THE LUMINAIRE WILL NOT DROP WHEN THE FRAMING MEMBERS NO LONGER
PROVIDE SUPPORT. AT A MINIMUM, 12 SWG WIRE WHICH IS FIRMLY SECURED
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE AND THE LUMINAIRES MUST BE UTILIZED. TWO
RESTRAINING WIRES AT OPPOSITE AND OPPOSING CORNERS ARE REQUIRED
FOR FLUORESCENT LUMINAIRES AND FOUR RESTRAINING WIRES, ONE AT EACH
CORNER, ARE REQUIRED WHEN INSTALLED IN FIRE RATED CEILINGS. OTHER
TYPES OF LUMINAIRES INSTALLED IN SUSPENDED CEILINGS MUST HAVE AT
LEAST ONE 12 SWG OR LARGER WIRE WHICH IS FIRMLY SECURED TO THE
BUILDING STRUCTURE AND THE LUMINAIRE AS A SECONDARY SUPPORT TO
PRECLUDE THE DANGER OF FALLING WHEN THE FRAMING MEMBERS FAIL OR
ARE REMOVED.”

(14) IN SUBSECTION 422.5(A) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), DELETE “(6)
SUMP PUMPS”.

(15) IN SUBSECTION 680.26(B)(2)(B) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), DELETE
THE LANGUAGE AFTER “ALTERNATE MEANS” INCLUDING (1) THROUGH (5) AND
INSERT THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IN LIEU THEREOF:

“WHERE STRUCTURAL REINFORCING STEEL IS NOT AVAILABLE OR IS
ENCAPSULATED IN A NONCONDUCTIVE COMPOUND, A COPPER CONDUCTOR
GRID SHALL BE PROVIDED AND SHALL COMPLY WITH (B)(1) THROUGH (B)(3).
(1) BE CONSTRUCTED OF MINIMUM 8 AWG BARE SOLID COPPER CONDUCTORS
BONDED TO EACH OTHER AT ALL POINTS OF CROSSING. (2) CONFORM TO THE
CONTOUR OF THE POOL AND THE POOL DECK. (3) BE ARRANGED IN A 300 MM
(12 INCH) NETWORK OF CONDUCTORS IN A UNIFORMLY SPACED
PERPENDICULAR GRID PATTERN WITH A TOLERANCE OF 100 MM (4 INCHES).”

(16) IN SUBSECTION 680.26(B)(2)(A) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE {2020), ADD THE
FOLLOWING AFTER THE WORD “SHALL” IN THE SECOND LINE: “BE A MINIMUM OF 3/8
IN. THICK AND”.

(17) IN SUBSECTION 680.26(B)(2)(B) OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020), ADD THE
FOLLOWING BEFORE THE WORD “WHERE” IN THE FIRST LINE: “FOR ABOVE GROUND
POOLS”.

DELETE INFORMATIVE ANNEX H OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (2020) IN ITS
ENTIRETY AND INSERT THE FOLLOWING IN LIEU

§ 180-5. Adoption of county regulations.

The following sections of Chapter105 Harford County, Electricity Code are adopted by reference
and shall apply to electricity services in the Town of Bel Air: § 105.1 through 105.49.



§ 180-6. Licensing and registration.

All persons performing electrical work in the Town of Bel Air shall be licensed and registered in
accordance with Article lll, Licenses and Registrations, of the Harford County Electrical Code. No
license or permit shall be required for installations of low-voltage systems of 50 volts or less
within a dwelling.

§ 180-7. Permit required.

No work authorized under this chapter, unless ACCEPTED in this chapter, shall be undertaken
without an electrical permit issued by the Harford County Division of Electrical Services under
the authority of the Town of Bel Air.

§ 180-8. Inspections.

The Harford County Division of Electrical Services shall perform the inspection of all electrical
work for which an electrical permit is required in the Town of Bel Air during the course of
construction and upon completion of the construction. If any defects are found, the Town of
Bel Air shall have the authority to order such electrical work to be corrected to comply with the
provisions of the code.

§ 180-9. Administration and enforcement.

This chapter shall be administered and enforced by the Department of Public Works, herein
referred to as the "Department."

§ 180-10. Right of entry.

The Director or an authorized representative, upon exhibiting proper credentials or proof of
identity on request, has the right to enter any building, structure or premises, except private
residences, without consent of the occupants, at any time during business or operating hours
and at such other times as may be necessary in any emergency that immediately endangers life,
property or public safety for the purpose of enforcing this chapter. In the case of multiple
dwellings, the Director or an authorized representative has the right to enter without consent
only those spaces to which the public is ordinarily admitted, such as hallways, basements and
similar spaces, provided that the Director or an authorized representative may enter any
private residence or dwelling for the purpose of enforcing this chapter with the consent of the
occupants or without such consent if the Director obtains an administrative search warrant in
accordance with prescribed legal procedure or if there is an emergency present.

§ 180-11. Violations and penalties.

Any person in violation of the provisions of this chapter and rules and regulations promulgated
pursuant thereto shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and, upon conviction thereof, shall



be subject to penalty as provided in Chapter 1, Article Hl of this Code. In addition, the Town may
institute other appropriate legal actions for the enforcement of this chapter.

§ 180-12. Emergency disconnections.

Where any electrical system, whether installed before or after the enactment of this chapter, is
determined by the Director to be an immediate threat to the safety of persons or property, or
where it may interfere with the fire-protection service of any fire department in the county, the
Director shall have authority to cause the electrical system to be disconnected immediately
without prior notice to the owner.

§ 180-13. Fees.

Prior to the issuance of any permit or license as provided for in this chapter, the applicant shall
pay a fee in accordance with the schedule of fees established and revised by Harford County.
Fees for electrical permits are separate from the fees paid for building permits and will be paid
directly to the Harford County Division of Electrical Services.

AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED by the Board of Town Commissioners that this
ordinance shall become effective on, 2021.

INTRODUCTION:
PUBLIC HEARING:
ENACTMENT:
EFFECTIVE:

AYES:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

Amy G. Chmielewski, Chair
Board of Town Commissioners



